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entries. December 10, 2009 Created by WorkBot to add works ←Proteam 1 2 3 ... 7 Next→ Visit the Help section or contact us demonstrates an easy-to-use system of gaming and winning blackjack, showing how to get an unrivalled edge at home, and includes a country-by-country guide to the casino world. The most powerful, simple system available ...
easy to learn Lance and I worked together on behavioral research for years. He's like a psychologist and I'm a technology management consultant. His system and my computer background made it the perfect match to teach hi-opt I system in our book. The Hi-Opt I system is considered to be the most powerful and simple system that can be developed.
Since math hasn't changed with Blackjack, that's why our book continues to be a leader. We also worked hard to make the book fun and the system is easy to learn. We incorporated the stories from our thousands of hours to the casino, and introduced the Hi-Opt I system in an easy-to-use, step-by-step fashion. Someone pays an electricity bill for signs
outside the casino... But not our readers! The revised edition of the player's Bible blackjack, with full information on odds, betting strategies, and more - is now updated to include the rules of the game in Atlantic City as well as international game rules. Lance Humble, a professional blackjack player and co-author of the greatest blackjack book in the world,
began his career by teaching horse racing in a course at the University of Toronto in York known as Aspects of Gambling. Since then he has taught several other classes on blackjack and horse racing, as well as various other casino games. Blackjack's greatest book in the world, written by Lance Humble, Blackjack's Greatest Book in the World, was the first
book about counting maps I've ever read. But it's not a nostalgia trip, I truly believe it's one of the best blackjack books you could ever read. It was first published in 1980, not so long ago in fact, but the language is a little out of date. This may be because the author was an elderly man from another time, or it could be because he was not a writer by
profession and just emulate the style he saw elsewhere. Whatever the reason, this style actually makes the book easier to read and understand, laying out the basics of counting cards in a very simple manner. The book covers a wide range of information, from the mindset you have to evolve in order to become a winner, for reasons you have to play
blackjack first. It's just it doesn't really matter, but if you have some time to kill, then you might as well read it. If not, you can skip ahead to the good stuff. The second section of the book explains how to play blackjack. Some information about the casino environment seems dated, but the information about the game itself and the underlying strategy is brilliant,
and that in itself is worth the price of the book. Section three describes how to choose a place to play, and it absolutely doesn't matter in the modern era, since fluff in section one, you don't miss much by ignoring it. You can find more information elsewhere, such as the blackjack forum online. Section 4 discusses the dealer and it's also very dated. Much of
this speaks to how to avoid cheating on the part of the dealer, which is unlikely to happen in the modern era in the biggest casinos. This is another section you may miss. Section 5 discusses the game of smart games, as well as talks about the dealer's reading. Much of this is fluff, but it's still fun to read and considerably more relevant than the previous few
sections. Whether dealers can actually read effectively or not is the story for another day, but the author seems to think so and lays his strategy open to us in this book. The sixth section provides one of the best tutorials on blackjack strategy that you'll find anywhere. Instead of just offering a large chart to remember, Humble organizes a basic strategy in
several charts based on the type of hand you've dealt with. It breaks it into manageable pieces, making it easy to read, easy to understand and easy to implement. Section 7 explains the Hi-Opt I card counting system, which guides you on how to implement it correctly. It also includes information on how the size of your bets are based on the account. This is
one of the best sections in the book, and certainly one of the most valuable. This system is discussed in more detail in section 8, which also shows how to optimize your profit when using this system. These are the two parts that makes the book, there's no doubt about it, and it's these two sections that make it one of the best books out there. There are still
some tips on the system in section ten, while Section Nine talks about home blackjack games. There are two more sections after that, but they are just more filler and can be ignored. The greatest blackjack book in the world is really a great read. It's not perfect, and somehow from it really, but if you ignore the extra sections and dated writing, then it's easily
one of the best books of its kind out there. The greatest Blackjack book in the world is available through Kindle for about $11.99. It's a steep price, but it's almost worth it. If it's too much, then you should be able to pick up a used copy for a couple of dollars. If you want a detailed The Greatest Blackjack Books, visit Google Books. They have 100 pages of it
available as a preview, so you can just dig into the chapters I recommended. A revised and updated edition of the Blackjack Player Bible with full information on odds, betting strategies, and more significant contributions to blackjack literature . . . I recommend the book to both beginners and experts. -Edward O. Thorpe, author of Beat The DealerThis is the
most comprehensive guide ever published on blackjack, the only casino game in which a knowledgeable player can gain an advantage over the house. It has Hi-Opt I, the most powerful simple betting system available today, and has been revised and updated to include the rules of the game in Atlantic City, as well as up-to-date information on international
rules of the game. Regardless of your level of experience, it will teach you how to make as much money as possible by playing your cards. You'll learn: How to choose a casino, with ever-major casinos in the world rated by the name How to Choose a Dealer How to Save from Cheating How to Play Cards, Using a Basic Strategy to Your Interests How to Win
At Home and las Vegas Nights How to Save From Prohibition once you're the winner of a revised and updated edition of the player's Bible Blackjack with full information about odds, betting strategies, and more. I recommend the book to both beginners and experts. -Edward O. Thorpe, author of Beat The DealerThis is the most comprehensive guide ever
published on blackjack, the only casino game in which a knowledgeable player can gain an advantage over the house. It has Hi-Opt I, the most powerful simple betting system available today, and has been revised and updated to include the rules of the game in Atlantic City, as well as up-to-date information on international rules of the game. Regardless of
your level of experience, it will teach you how to make as much money as possible by playing your cards. You'll learn: How to choose a casino, with ever the largest casino in the world rated by the name How to choose a dealer How to save from cheating How to play cards using the basic strategy to your advantage How to win at home and in Las Vegas
Nights How to save from being banned as soon as you winner Be the first to know! Great book picks await Great Book picks waiting to fire Thank You! Something amazing along the way. Back to start Visiting Other Sites in Penguin Random House Network
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