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Dragon's dogma badge of vows 13

Share reviews from a different sky - Part 2 Vote Badge 13 is a medal of votes badge obtained while searching for a different sky of the same number. The badge is the remnant of an old Riftstone, picking it up earns a reward from Rift Crystals. In the original Dragon Dogma, The 13 Vote Badge is obtained as part of the
From A Different Sky research package – Part 2 DLC, in Dark Arisen, the search is included in the base game. Overview A badge that shines in a mysterious light. Similar medals can be found scattered around Gransys. Found at The Everfall in Great Soren. The collection of this article gives a reward of 2 Rift clusters
and 1,000 experience. This article can be doubled in The Black Cat by 18,750 Or. Walkthrough The badge is located in Everfall on the fifth underground level. At the end of the short flight of stairs leading to the lower floor, head forward and make a turn around the pillar closest to the right. You will face a rock formation
lining a dead end - the insignia is on a ledge halfway easily accessible to climb to the right side. Extended jumping capacity is not required. Notes not available after the game. The voting badge numbers 11, 12, 13, 20, 21, 22, 31, 32 and 80 are not available during post-game due to catalytic events. In addition, 33, 34,
51, 69 and 77 cannot be obtained after a warm welcome due to the inaccessibility of the Duke's Demesne. The 20 vote badge can also be found in everfall community content is available under CC-BY-SA unless otherwise stated. Insignia of Votes 84 is an element in dragon dogma. A badge that shines in mysterious
light. Similar medals can be found scattered around Gransys. Insignia of Votes 84 is a research element obtained during the search for a different sky – Part 9. The badge is the remnant of an ancient rift stone, collecting it earns a reward of crack crystals. The collection of this article gives a reward of 1 Rift Clusters and
1,000 experience. This article can be doubled in The Black Cat by 18,750 Gold. It is located in Great Soren (Post-Game/Dragon) - on the roof of the stables near the south gate of the city. The badge is best obtained before the search for a warm welcome. It is better to get jumping from the Tower south to a nearby roof,
and then falling to the stable roof. From a different sky – Part 9 Note: This is only used to report spam, advertising and problematic (harassment, fight or rude) sites. Thank you for printing this www.SuperCheats.com page. Remember to check back for updates to this guide and much more content for dragon dogma: Dark
Arisen Last updated: May 14, 2013 This is a long search where you have Locate the 1 to 100 vote badge in dark and challenging locations of the game. You can do this anytime you want and you will be awarded experienced and rift crystals. These missions can be accepted from the basement of the Pawn Pawn Guild
Council. The order of the missions that will be available will depend on the numbers you have completed. The preferred class to find the badges is the Magick Archer as you will have access to both Levitate and Double-Vault. You will also have the ability to shoot the badges on high-walled ceilings using your magic bow.
From a different sky region 1: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 1 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 The first waypoint is in Cassardis. This is on the roof of the house marked, in a chimney. From a different sky region 2: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 2 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 The second waypoint is
on the roof again, this time on the edge of the brick wall corner on the roof. From a different sky region 3: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 3 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 This is in a chimney on the roof of the fisherman's hut, near the coastal cliff north of the village. From a different sky region 4: See Waypoint
Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 4 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 from Cape Adaro's house, carefully jump onto the ledge to the east and find a small cave with a tombstone to find the badge. From a different sky region 5: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 5 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 This is located on the roof of the
collapsed meeting room west of Great Soren. From a different sky region 6: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 6 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 In the immediate south of the collapsed meeting room, west of Great Soren is an ancient remnant of a bridge. Climb from the side to find the badge on the edge, at the top
of the structure. From a different sky region 7: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 7 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 This is on the roof of the Mountain House, on the mountain pass between Great Soren and the waycastle. The roof can be reached with a double jump on the broken part of the wall, to the left of the
door of the house. Only the strident, rangers and assassins have the ability to double jump. If you use a killer and are equipped with a sword and a shield, you may need to remove them in order to make a double jump. From a different sky region 8: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 8 Reward: Rift Cluster x1
Found on a rock beside the coast, southeast of Conquest Road From a Different Sky 9 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 9 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Found in broken bow north of waycastle. From a different sky region 10: See Waypoint scoreboard acquire 10 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1
Inside Witchwood. Just follow the scoreboard and you'll find this at the top of a blog. From a different region of sky 11: View waypoint Acquire 11 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 This is located on the roof of the building in front of Fountain Square. Find the ladder in the revenge area that leads to rooftops and and
your way to the bookmark to get this badge. From a different sky region 12: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 12 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 After getting badge 11, head to the next scoreboard. It is located on a porch to find a wooden ledge to leave and collect the insignia in the wooden box. From a different
sky 13 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 13 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Found on the Bottom Floor of Everfall, at the top of the rubble. From a different sky region 14: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 14 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 This is a little difficult to reach and will test your careful timing
and movement. The insignia itself is hanging on the rocky cliff next to the Unnamed Falls. From a different sky 15 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 15 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Found on a ledge next to a wolf den. It will be easier to get there from the cliff. From a different sky 16 Region: See
Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 16 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Inside the Old Quarry, by the small rock window. From a different sky 17 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 17 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Inside the Altar of the Water God, ground floor. Just find the marker on the map and you will
find the badge in a stone block. From a different sky 18 Region: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire 18 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Within the lower level of the catacomb. Follow the marker and you'll find this badge on a lower ledge next to the stone bridge. From a different sky 19 Region: See Waypoint
Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 19 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Inside the Shadow Fort. Follow the marker and you'll find this badge next to the campfire. From a different sky region 20: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 20 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 This is at the bottom of Everfall, at the top of one of the pillars
there. You can reach it by climbing the top ledge in front of it and then make a long jump to get there. From a different sky region 21: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 21 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Go to The Great Soren Rooftops through the Venery and find this badge stuck next to a fireplace. From a
different sky region 22: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 22 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Found on the Roof of the Inn, on the edge of the pointed tower. From a different sky 23 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 23 Reward: Rift Cluster Inside the catacombs. Just follow the marker on the
lower level and you'll find this behind the iron gate. The road is simple because you don't have to worry about getting lost. From a different sky region 24: see Waypoint scoreboard acquire 24 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 within the This lies behind the chest at the death of a narrow road. It can be reached by taking
the opposite direction after reaching the path of the wooden walkway leading to the meeting room. From a different sky region 25: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 25 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 This is located on a ledge in the station room, inside the strong shadow. You have to be a magician, sorcerer or
magic archer and you have to have main skill Levitate skill. Climb the staircase next to the station room and get as close as possible to the wooden ledge in the corner. Jump and use levity to get there. From a different sky region 26: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 26 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 On a canvas



cover inside the Fort Shade. You have to go up the ballerista station and jump from there. From a different sky 27 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 27 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Rooftop Miner's Toolshed, west of the Eradication Site. From a different sky region 28: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire
Vote Badge 28 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Found on a Ledge, on the second underground level of Soulflayer Canyon. From a different sky 29 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 29 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Make Your Way Back to the Top Divided Path on the First Floor Underground Level. This is where
a narrow stone bridge lies. Follow it until you reach the part where you have to slide along the wet slopes. Swipe left and follow it until you reach another division. Slide right this time to reach a wide ledge. You'll find the badge in the corner near the edge. From a different sky region 30: See Waypoint scoreboard acquire
30 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Inside the Blue Moon Tower. You can only enter the main area through a history mission. It will be wise to visit it and deploy a portcrystal so you can easily return to it as needed. Head to the second floor of the tower and follow the marker. You should find the badge near the edge
of the floor. From a region other than Heaven 31: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 31 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Go to venery rooftops and head to the marked location. Find the entrance to an attic storage room to find the badge. From a different sky region 32: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge
32 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 found in the slums of Great Soren. Follow the marker to find this badge on the ground. From a different sky region 33: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 33 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Found in duke's Demesne, on a ledge behind the throne, between the two stairs. From a Different
Sky 34 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 34 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 In gardens outside the Duke's Demesne. You have to go up to the Observation Room of the walls of the castle to reach the roof of the house where the insignia is located. Badge. a Different Sky 35 Region: See Waypoint
scoreboard Acquire vote badge 35 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Found in the northernmost corner of the test grounds, under the shadow fort. From a different sky region 36: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 36 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 This is in the top th level of the soulflayer canyon area. From the entrance of
Greatwall, we follow the path to the left and cross the stone bridge. We follow the path and reach the wet slopes. Slide right until you reach a small ledge where the marker is located. Look carefully at the ground to find the badge near the edge of the slope. From a different sky 37 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard
Acquire 37 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Enter the Fortress and follow the scoreboard. Climb over the wall to find this in the narrow space behind the wall. From a different sky region 38: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 38 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Southeast from the camp entrance is a very narrow
ledge along the cliff. Follow it and you'll find the badge stuck near the end. From a different sky region 39: See Waypoint scoreboard acquire 39 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x3 These will be available after defeating the Cockatrice as part of the main story (and after completing previous missions from different sky)
During the main quest to recapture the Great Wall, defeat the chimera within the suspension to continue. Finally you will find a set of stairs. Next to it is a spiral staircase. You'll find the badge on the roof above. From a different sky region 40: See Waypoint scoreboard acquire 40 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2
These will be available after defeating the Cockatrice as part of the main story (and after completing earlier from a different heaven missions) During the fight with two Wights in pursuit of Denying Salvation, you need to shoot from the bow on the north side of the fortress If you've finished the search without getting this,
this badge will be inaccessible until you start the search again in New Game + From a Different Sky 41 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 41 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Towards the Scoreboard at Vestad Hills and then jump to the nearby lake. Enter the cavern there to find the badge at the end. From a
different sky 42 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 42 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 This is located at the altar of the tomb of the unknown traveler. There is also a golem in the area to be prepared to fight or escape it. From a different sky region 43: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire 43 Vote Badge
Reward: Rift Cluster x2 in wilted forest where a chimera and several goblins (day) or one ogres (night) are coming out. Kill them all and then look for the box inside the scoreboard to find this badge. From a different sky 44 Region: See Waypoint scoreboard acquire 44 vote badge Reward: Rift Cluster x3 On a rock nearby
small lake, southeast of the Shadow Fort. There's a dragon nearby, so be careful not to compromise you if you're still weak. From a different sky 45 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 45 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Toward the Scoreboard West of the Abbey, beyond the river. Here you will find a small
cavern called Beast Cave. Defeat the enemies inside and you will find the badge on the table. From a different sky region 46: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 46 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 At the abandoned campsite east of Hillfigure Knoll. There are a lot of bandits here so be prepared. You'll find the badge
on the floor. From a different sky 47 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 47 Reward: Rift Cluster x3 Found in The Road Division South of Soulflayer Canyon East Entrance. There is a cyclops in this area so you may have to defeat to plunder the badge on the road, next to a corpse of animals. From a
different sky 48 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 48 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Next to a tree trunk on the ground near Prayer Falls. From a different sky 49 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 49 Reward: Rift Cluster x3 Found Next to a Cow Carcass, near its mouth in the western
area at the Conqueror Sanctuary. From a different sky region 50: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 50 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Inside a broken stone coffin in the northwestern portion of Barta Crags. From a different sky region 51: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 51 Reward: Rift Cluster x1
Inside the Duchess's bed room, stuck on top of the bed. You have to hit to evict them from your location. From a different sky 52 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 52 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Inside Old Quarry. Behind the shopkeeper is the badge marker. Look at the roof to find him staying there.
You have to attack her with an arrow or use a vertical magic to evict her. From a different sky 53 Region: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire 53 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Inside Old Quarry. Head to the marker on the narrow road and find this plaque lodged in a stone arch next to the ceiling. Use a bow, skills or
spells to vacate it. From a different sky 54 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 54 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Inside the Shadow Fort. Enter the marked building and head to the basement. You'll find the badge hanging at the end of the chains. Evict it by using bow + arrow, vertical skills or spells. From a
different region of sky 55: View waypoint marker Voting Badge 55 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 On the Altar of the Water God, head to the offering chamber and find the marker. The badge is attached to the side of the pillar. Evict it by using bow + arrow, vertical skills or spells. From a different sky region 56: see waypoint
bookmark purchase purchase Of Votes 56 Reward: Rift Cluster x3 On the Altar of the Water God, make your way to the first level underground and follow the marker. You have to find the badge on the ground before the stairs. From a different sky 57 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 57 Vote Badge Reward:
Rift Cluster x2 Inside the Pit in Cassardis. Continue until you reach the largest cavern where the Saurians are formerly located. Now this is a difficult part. Look towards the ceiling and take note of this small circle in front of the beam of light. You'll notice it's a weak glow and it's a bit of a levity. Evict it by using bow +
arrow, vertical skills or spells. From a different sky region 58: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 57 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Enter the well in Cassardis and head to the second chamber of the cave where you have previously cleared saurian nests. Go to the scoreboard and point to the ceiling. It can be
difficult to detect especially with lighting in the area, but so refer to the image below. Take note of the direction the cursor points. If you're not sure, point to the big root and stand still until you notice a small object glowing faintly. From a different sky region 59: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 59 Reward:
Rift Cluster x2 This is located at the eastern exit of Soulflayer Canyon. It is stuck on the wooden support beams. Evict it by using bow + arrow, vertical skills or spells. From a different sky region 60: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 60 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 On the first floor of the tower. Go to the
scoreboard and look up the wall. You should see a weak, bright circle. Evict it by using bow + arrow, vertical skills or spells. From a different sky region 61: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire 61 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Follow the marker west of Vestad Hills and follow the path high down the cliff. Once you've
reached the scoreboard, look below to find a small ledge you can jump. You'll find the badge along with the pile of bones. From a different sky region 62: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 62 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 This is on the ledge of witchwood's alternative output. You have to go through the woods
again and go out the alternative exit to find this plate on the ground. From a different sky region 63: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 63 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Towards the scoreboard in the cavernous pastona. You have to find an opening on the mountainside. Grab the ledges to get to this room. The
badge is on the table inside. From a different sky region 64: See waypoint scoreboard Acquire 64 vote badge Rift Cluster x1 Towards the scoreboard and you should see it surface above. Find the room with the stairs leading to one of these outcrop and levitation/double jump through. Enter the room where the marker is
located and you will find badge on the ground, near the corner. From a different sky region 65: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 65 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 On the Offshore Rock at Cape Pactforge. You may want to use Levitate or Double Jump to cross the brine-infested water and reach the bottom of the
rock. From a different sky region 66: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 66 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Found on a ledge by the moutainside, west of the healing source southwest of Gransys. Just follow the marker and follow the cliff. Leave the ledge and grab the badge behind your chest. From a different sky
67 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 67 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Find the tower west of the ruins of Aernst Castle and slide down the narrow ledge below. Follow it down to find the badge at the end. From a different sky region 68: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 68 Reward: Rift
Cluster x1 Go to the Cliff east of the soulflayer canyon entrance to the east. Head to the scoreboard and jump to the track. You will not slide while carefully step on the highest ledge. Find the badge at the end. From a different sky 69 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 69 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1
Inside the Duke Dungeon. You need a skeleton key to open the cell and find the badge on the floor. From a different sky region 70: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 70 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x3 Found on a Shore Block in Cassardis. You have to traverse the water and keep jumping/levitating to avoid being
taken by brine. From a different sky region 71: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire 71 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Located at the northwest exit of Gran Soren, on top of a small pillar. This is a little hard to come by and you have to use a magical archer specifically for this one. First, locate the largest and highest
ruin nearby and climb from behind. You have to unseal your staff and use the double jump to reach the highest structure first. Once you are on top, you have to equip your staff again. Run to the edge and jump. Now, before falling, time your levitation activation to reach the solitary pillar. You'll find the badge. From a
different sky region 72: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 72 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Towards the Path and Follow the Narrow Path Around It, giving rise to the Altar of the Water God. There is a dead hill where several goblins are camped. Later on there is a barely noticeable ledge. You need a double jump
character to climb the right side of the ledge. You will find the in the middle of the jars and in the chest. From a different sky region 73: See Waypoint scoreboard acquire 73 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Towards the Scoreboard outside the entrance to Old Quarry. There is a stone ledge that can only be reached by
stepping on a nearby barrel and performing a Jump quickly over the barrel and double jump to reach the ledge before your allies destroy the barrel automatically. From a different sky region 74: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 74 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Towards the marked location and climb up the stone
ledge to find this badge. From a different sky region 75: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 75 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Enter the catacombs and follow the path leading to the scoreboard. There is an opening above the pile of coffins that you can climb to reach a secret area. Pick up the badge on the floor.
From a different sky region 76: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 76 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Enter camp and head to the scoreboard. Go to the top of the tent to find the badge there. From a different sky 77 Region: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 77 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 On the second
floor, from duke's Demesne. Go to your room and you'll find this badge on the edge of the fireplace. Evict him though it will prove difficult. From a different sky region 78: See Waypoint scoreboard Acquire vote badge 78 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Found on the raised cliff next to Guardian's tomb. You may need levity or
double jump to get there. img=SC-S_Vow78.jpg title=] From a different sky 79 Region: See waypoint marker Acquire vote badge 79 Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Towards the ruins of Aernst and go to the scoreboard. The badge is located at the top of the ruined tower. You can use levitate to achieve it. However, this requires
proper placement. Stand on top of the nearby broken wall and position yourself carefully in the corner. Jump and use levity at the right time so you can slowly slide towards the edge of the tower and grab it. Destroy the box to reveal the badge. From a different sky region 80: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote
Badge 80 Reward: Rift Cluster x3 After ever entering, just follow the scoreboard and you'll find this badge shortly on a hanging torch carrier. From a different sky 87 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 87 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Go inside the Great Wall and head to tree in the small area of the
cemetery. You'll find the badge stuck between the roots. From a different sky region 91: See Waypoint scoreboard acquire 91 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Enter Witchwood and head to the witch house. Before you get to the clear area around the witch house it must be a cliff. You have to jump across the abyss to
reach the dark area and find that badge. See the following images. From Different Sky Region 92: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 92 Reward: Rift Cluster x3 To the other side of the prayer falls and continue until you reach the scoreboard. Then carefully fall down where the tree is below to find the badge
on the cliff. From a different sky 93 region: see waypoint bookmark purchase badge from 93 Reward: Rift Cluster x1 Head first to the mountain house and get closer to the scoreboard. It is found on rock outcrops across the breach. Use levity to get there. From a different sky region 94: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire
94 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Toward Windbluff Tower and proceed to the scoreboard. Climb up the ladder and then get into marker. Climb over the tower and fall down to the narrow ledge below to find this plate. From a different sky 95 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire Vote Badge 95 Reward: Rift
Cluster x3 Towards Windworn Valley and climb the hill with the cage. Now you have to make a jump run and then levitate to reach the other hill to the east. You may want to weather your jump as soon as you reach the edge of the hill then activate the levity at the right time to reach the edge of the other hill. The badge is
lying on the ground at the top of the hill. From a different sky region 96: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 96 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x3 Towards the Tomb of the Unknown Traveler then proceed towards the mark. You should see a separate rock tower. You have to perform a jump run then levitate at the right
distance to get there. You'll find the badge on the floor. From a different sky region 97: See Waypoint scoreboard acquire 97 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x3 Go inside bluemoon tower and make your way to the end of the stairs, passing the scoreboard. Now, you have to make a running leap towards the broken
walls, near the marker through the abyss, and levitate to extend your flight. After reaching the wall, proceed to the marker and grab the nearby ledge to pull up. The badge is glued to the wall. From a different sky 98 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 98 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x3 Outside Bluemoon
Tower. It is located in the ruins of pillars/arches. You have to climb the slope a little after making a running jump to reach the lower arch. Jump to the highest bow to climb and pick up this plate. From a different sky 99 Region: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 99 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x3 Go to the old quarry
and head to the scoreboard. Use a spell to destroy the rocks above the door inside the marker to reveal the hidden badge. From a different sky region 100: See Waypoint Scoreboard Acquire 100 Vote Badge Reward: Rift Cluster x2 Hillfigure Knoll. go to the marker and climb on the pointed rock to find the badge on the
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