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Summit view elementary waukesha wi

Welcome to Summit View Elementary School! It is one of 13 elementary schools in the Waukesha school district. Summit View opened in the fall of 1992. It is the largest elementary school in the waukesha school district with a small community feel that we strive to know and improve each child's unique qualities. Summit View's physical structure gives students the best of all
educational environments. Input to the design of the building was sought from educators, students, parents and business leaders. There are seven teaching pods that house approximately 550 students in 3K to fifth. Within each pod there are options for individual as well as small and large group instruction. A central common area, surrounded by bookshelves and co-op spaces,
opens out into four classrooms in each of the pods. Moving walls allow teachers to vary the learning environment. iPads are available for each student starting kindergarten. Other technologies available to students and staff include Chromebooks, data projectors, visual presenters, smart boards, green screens, mobile TV carts with Apple TV and Elmo projectors. Teaching at
Summit View follows the rigorous curriculum of reading, writing and science in the Waukesha school district. Our teacher's instructional practices are enriched by their continued development in the fields of art integration, technology and personal learning. Setting the school, with its surrounding landscape and wooded areas, enhances this optimal learning environment and allows
students to demonstrate their learning in different learning modalities. The staff at Summit View includes a number of teaching strategies and philosophies. Best practices such as Reader's and Writer's workshop are utilized. Using the District Response to Intervention (R.T.I.) model, interventions occur to provide additional support to students. Students are encouraged to develop
independence, be creative and critical thinkers, appreciate and respect individual differences, and become effective problem solvers. We want all our students to become lifelong learners. Using a Professional Learning Community model, Summit View's employees collaborate to share ideas, analyze data, and plan lessons to help all students succeed. Open communication
between home and school is essential. Parental input is one of the keys to student success. We are proud of Summit View and the children who participate in it. If you ever have any questions, feel free to contact the principal, Mr. Sheskey. The Waukesha school district does not discriminate in its admissions, programs, activities, services or employment on the basis of sex, age,
race, colour, national origin, ancestry, faith, pregnancy, marital or parental status, sexual orientation, physical, mental, emotional or learning difficulties, for any reason; state or federal laws or regulations. The district provides equal access to the Scouts and other designated youth groups. The following individuals have been appointed to handle inquiries regarding the District's non-
discrimination policies and procedures: Sharon Thiede, Assistant Superintendent for The Human ResourcesSchool District of Waukesha - 222 Maple Avenue, Waukesha, WI 53186262-970-1031 or sthiede@waukesha.k12.wi.usJoe Koch, Deputy Superintendent's School District of Waukesha - 222 Maple Avenue, Waukesha, WI 53186262-970-1107 or jkoch@waukesha.k12.wi.us
Learn more about how to get involved Housing for rent &amp; sales near this school This school is rated below average in school quality compared to other schools in Wisconsin. Students here are making below average year-over-year academic improvements,... More this school has about average results in how good it is to serve disadvantaged students, and students perform
above average on state tests. Students at this school are making far less academic progress given where they were last year, compared to similar students in the state. Very low progress with high test scores means that students have strong academic skills, but that pupils at this school make less gains than similar students in other schools. Parents tip Test scores at this school
are above the state average. Because test scores in some states are so low, some students at this school still can't perform at grade level Parents tip Note something missing or confusing? Equity Disadvantaged students at this school are doing around as well as other students in the state, but this school can still have achievement gaps. Parents tip Student results of percentile
Low income and underserved students All other students in the school's ENVIRONMENT (10 are best) Better than 74.5% of WI schools. (10 is best) Better than 82.0% of U.S. schools. Posted May 04, 2018 Posted by a parent Fantastic. Our fourth year at the school. We love it. Posted February 22, 2017 Posted by a parent Staff at this school is absolutely amazing. They all care
about the students, make sure the students have a good experience, teach the kids that it's ok to be different and not bully or make fun of others. Great support team for kids with developmental disabilities as well. Posted September 29, 2014 Posted by a parent In an instant, this is one of the most impressive buildings I've ever seen for a primary school. I was also impressed that
they take this school of the future approach of having pods instead of classrooms, iPads, art integrated into their studies, and yes I think art should be in school. But here's what you don't see under the artistic façade: disorganization that you wouldn't believe. Disorganization on the parent pick-up line, when you call the office, disorganization when you ask them them send
homework home when your child is sick (we still can't pick up homework!), disorganizing in the fact that there are no textbooks. No books on math. NO BOOKS in science. Sure it's great to have experience but how are these kids going to study their maths at home when they have no reference? Go to the website they say... what website??? IXL is a website created for children to
study, but it does not relate to their exact device or skill they cover at each school. If your child is sick and misses school, they miss the experience. So it's impossible to catch up. I miss textbooks. Posted January 31, 2014 Posted by a parent My Child Loves Summit View. They have grown to be more Arts focused, which she enjoys. This year she has been involved in drama
lessons, experiences live musical performances at lunch; we have also seen highlighted learning about famous artists, musicians and historical figures. They encourage individualized learning - she can advance through reading at higher levels and work with subjects of her choice in her spare time. Outstanding 1st class teacher. Focused on positive choice and continued
learning/demonstrated development. PTO is ok, school offers a wellness team that promotes a healthy lifestyle for kids, we like it. Posted January 18, 2013 Posted by a Parent Love school so far! My daughter has had great experiences in the two years she has been here. Posted May 30, 2012 Posted by a parent This is a good school if your child doesn't need extra help to
succeed. I'm a very involved parent and don't expect the school to do it all, but I basically got told when I asked the school to evaluate my son (via IDEA, IEP, 501 plan) that unless he doesn't have any additional help will be provided. So with that said... be prepared that unless your child is not, do not expect this school's administration to give your child extra help. No, they'd rather
your child FAIL first (and thus decrease their self-esteem and of course when that happens, it's that much harder for your child to think they're smart and can succeed). Unfortunately, I don't think other schools in Waukesha would be any different. It's about money and not about the kids anymore. Case in point ... the doctor I met with to evaluate my child (a child neurologist) was
boggled about why he wasn't already getting help. His pediatrician said the same thing. It was also said by doctors that if I expect any help from Waukesha that I would be better off getting a lawyer. Why would I do that, I ask? Why can't our schools just be expected to do the right thing? Posted May 18, 2011 Posted by a parent both my children attend the summit viewing. excellent
teachers who inspire children. All the teachers that my boys have had as teachers are engaged enjoy teaching and are really interested in their growth. Growth. school Thank you for submitting a rating too! Check your inbox for instructions on approving your review. We are adding new health and safety measures to our programmes for the 2020-2021 school year. Registered
families will receive additional information. Pre School programs ensure every child has opportunities to build positive relationships based on trust, honesty and respect in a safe environment. Choice-based programs allow children to pursue their individual interests through practical activities. Full- or part-time weekly attendance is available, Monday to Friday. We accept most third-
party funding sources and offer scholarship funds to eligible families. Site Supervisor: Samantha Dufek Program Phone: 414-380-8801 Pre-school hours: 7-8:40 a.m. Location: Top level gym, room 346 Summit View Elementary website We add new health and safety measures to our programs for the 2020-2021 school year. Registered families will receive additional information.
After School programs ensure every child has opportunities to build positive relationships based on trust, honesty and respect in a safe environment. Choice-based programs allow children to pursue their individual interests through practical activities. Full- or part-time weekly attendance is available, Monday to Friday. We accept most third-party funding sources and offer
scholarship funds to eligible families. Site Supervisor: Samantha Dufek Program Phone: 414-380-8801 After school hours: 3:40-6 p.m. Location: Top level gym, room 346 Summit View Elementary Website Important information First child is considered the one with the most days Weekly enrollment fees appear; fees billed every week during the school year school year handling
fee: Required at the time of registration $30 for a child $50 for two or more children After school fees will not be pro-rated for lost days, school closures, non-school days or public holidays, except for winter and spring break weeks Last billing period pro-rated based on the last day of the school year calendars program may be changed; Tentative; invoiced days will be adjusted
accordingly Contact the Administration Office or see the program manual for more information on fees and payments 2020-2021 After School Payment Schedule Semester Discount (2.5%) Option: Prepayment Due Date Semester I: Tuesday, September 8, 2020 Semester II: Tuesday, January 5, 2021 At this time, we are not able to off All Day Programs on non-school days in the
first semester. We will continue to work with our district partners to determine space availability and programming options for scheduled non-school days in the second semester. Check back for more information. Information.
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