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Picture: HBO The Seven Kingdoms are known for many things: dragons, wars, power-hungry people and, of course, names. A person's name in Game of Thrones can say a lot about their background. First, a name tells people if you belong to a house, if that house is powerful, or if you're a bastard with no family ties or
power. It then allows people to know how they should act in their presence; whether they should bend over or spit at their feet. Finally, a name can tell you what potential you have to succeed and survive in the world of Game of Thrones. Are you a Stark or Targaryen? Or are you something else? Let's ask you a few
questions about yourself, as well as some questions about what you think about the Seven Kingdoms. For us to give you the most accurate answer, you need to be as honest as possible (unlike Cersei when Septa Unella was interrogating her).) We ask you to be more like Tyrion when he's had too many glasses of beer.
If you want to know what your name would be from Seven Kingdoms, go ahead and start on this quiz! We promise there are no White Walkers waiting to ambush him on the next page. PERSONALITY What is your combination of Harry Potter House &amp; Game of Thrones? 5 Minutes Quiz 5 Min PERSONALITY Which
Game of Thrones Babe Are You? 5 Minutes Quiz 5 Min PERSONALITY What game of thrones would you have finished with? 5 Minute Quiz 5 Min PERSONALITY How would you die in Game of Thrones? 5 Minutes Quiz 5 Min TRIVIA Game of Thrones Family Tree Quiz 6 Minute Quiz 6 Min TRIVIA Can You Guess If
This Game of Thrones Name is real or fake? 6 Minutes Quiz 6 Min PERSONALITY What would be your Work of Game of Thrones? 5 Minutes Quiz 5 Min PERSONALITY Are you meant to become a white walker? 5 Minutes Quiz 5 Min PERSONALITY What rank would you achieve in Starfleet? 5 Minutes Quiz 5 Min
PERSONALITY What would be your magic wand? 5 Minute Quiz 5 Min How much do you know about dinosaurs? What is an octane? And how is an appropriate noun used? Luckily for you, HowStuffWorks Play is here to help. Our award-winning website offers reliable and easy-to-understand explanations of how the
world works. From fun quizzes that bring joy to your day, to engaging photos and fascinating lists, HowStuffWorks Play offers something for everyone. Sometimes we explain how things work, other times, we ask you, but we're always exploring in the name of fun! Because learning is fun, so stay with us! Playing quizzes
is free! We send trivial questions and personality tests every week to your inbox. By clicking Register, you agree to our privacy policy and confirm that you are 13 years of age or older. Copyright copyright © 2020 InfoSpace Holdings, LLC, a Queen: Game of Thrones sounds like a project born to someone spying on the
most ambitious crossover meme that made the rounds earlier this year and as a challenge. Mashing up the Tinder-meets-monarchy genius of the Reigns series with medieval fantasy mega-franchise Game of Thrones is such conceptual stroke of genius you have to wonder why didn't happen sooner. Now that the dream
is finally a reality, is Reigns: Game of Thrones worthy of the Iron Throne, or should it be thrown down Eyrie's Moon Gate? Let's find out! Reigns, Westeros styleFor the uninitiated, Reigns is an award-winning series of games developed by UK studio Nerial. Both the original Reigns and their sequel, Reigns: His Majesty,
crown the player as the king or queen of a kingdom full of soldiers, priests, peasants, charlatans, each with their own agendas and desires. Interactions with your ever-larger group of not-so-loyal subjects reproduce as a series of endless binary options in which you swipe left or right on the character card to make a
decision. Each election positively or negatively impacts your position with one or more of the four factions: army, church, people, treasure. Increase your position with any of these groups to the maximum or make it get to the bottom and you will quickly be deposed in a fatal and often hilarious way. Reigns has always
been a perfect series for short bursts of play on the go. The years of the game pass in minutes and, depending on how diligent you are with your choices, a single reign can last several decades or be violently interrupted in the youthful flower of your noble avatar. Reigns is a perfect game for short bursts of play on the go
(online or offline), but it's also fascinating enough to get lost for hours and hours. You can try to survive your record reign or unlock achievements that take each new ruler and, in the case of Reigns: His Majesty, progress through a general story that unfolds on a much larger cosmic scale. Fortunately, while there might
have been the temptation to adjust the formula to accommodate the Game of Thrones universe, Reigns: Game of Thrones retains the main gameplay and structure of its predecessors. This should be a great relief, as Reigns is one of the most unique games available on the Play Store, built to do as much as possible
with just a handful of simple gestures. In fact, one of the most impressive things about Reigns: Game of Thrones is how the Westerosi-flavored influence simultaneously feels like a basic reskin of the Reigns experience that replaces the original characters with memorable faces from books and TV shows, but also a
natural, sometimes bold, expansing expanses of the show's main mechanics. The four factions are fundamentally the now based on established parts of the Game of Thrones canon. The church is now represented by priests of the Faith of the Seven, while the Mint Master and representatives of the Iron Bank of Braavos
represent the treasure. More: 15 best Android offline gamesWhile many changes are obvious and and — you'll be sitting on the Iron Throne instead of a regular throne and listening a lot to the Game of Thrones theme — Reigns: Game of Thrones goes one step further. It is a true adaptation that perfectly recreates many
of the most popular characters in the HBO series without losing the ironic and dark comic edge of Reigns. You'll meet characters like Lord Varys, Samwell Tarly and Tyrion Lannister as you rule, and each is immediately recognizable not only through their charmingly designed sprites, but also through dialogue. The game
manages to convey all the traits and machinations of each character in just a few short sentences. New players unfamiliar with the Game of Thrones tradition won't miss too much, and fans will be able to savor every wink and nod to the broader story. Just don't come in expecting anything from the salty sex and free
violence of an average episode of the HBO series. This is still a Reigns game after all. A Swipe of Ice and FireReigns: The biggest twist of Game of Thrones, in both series, focuses on how he handles the main protagonist of each game. Set in a hypothetical scenario of what would happen if where the tyrannical Cersei
Lannister has been overthrown and expelled from King's Landing, you first realize the role of the Queen of Dragons favorite of all and new ruler of the Seven Kingdoms, Daenerys Targaryen.Soon you will realize that you really know nothing (Jon Snow). Once Dany inevitably bites the dust you will be greeted by the
mystical red priestess Melisandre who reflects on your fate, questioning whether Daenerys was really the reborn legendary hero the world has been looking for. This meta-narrative allows Reigns: Game of Thrones to feature nine playable characters, including Jon Snow and other fan favorites, each of which could be the
next Azor Ahai. This represents a big step forward for Reigns, who previously only played with the idea of several characters by giving the new rulers disposable names and titles. Reigns: Game of Thrones is a true adaptation that perfectly recreates many of the most popular characters in the HBO series without losing
the ironic and darkly comical edge of Reigns. While this can make all of this feel a little daunting (each leader has their own allies, enemies and objectives), the game intelligently separates the introduction of new player characters as the broader story constantly unfolds. Game of Thrones fans can also have some fun
with each new character, either playing a role in the decisions you think they would make based on their popular character, or essentially playing your own fan fiction. Do you want to turn the heroic Jon Snow into an autocrat blood-hungry and war-hungry? Reigns: Game of Thrones lets you do just that. No matter who
you choose, however, winter is always coming, and the threat of the White Walkers is never too far away. Figuring out how to survive the cold with each character requires patience, patience, and a little luck. Reigns: Game of Thrones also introduces branched decisions. They are usually quite inconsequential, such as
during small council meetings where one of the four people to talk to is chosen. Occasionally you'll see a hit effect on whether you decide to go to war or start or end loyalty. During a playthrough like Jon, I opted off Varys (yes, sometimes you can kill people with one hit now) and replaced it with a House Greyjoy
representative to overturn a military showdown between King's Landing and the Iron Islands.Unfortunately my new Whisper master wasn't so loyal and I finally had to raise sticks and return to Winterfell through another new game addition , travel between locations. Many of these movements are represented by simple
background transitions, but others will see you traveling along a segmented path with decisions to make along the way. The night is dark and full of bugsFor all the wits behind Reigns and his adaptation of the Game of Thrones license, some niggles still take away from previous entries in the series. The most enraging
are the seemingly random results of some of his choices. Occasionally you swipe left or right thinking you'll be appeasing the church or saving money just to infuriating a priest or ending up homeless. Sudden deaths and fleeting reigns are part of general design, but some of the most vague and cryptic scriptures can
occasionally lead to early death that feels unjust. More: 15 best role-playing games for AndroidThe usable items of Reigns: Her Majesty have also been discarded, which feels like a step backwards considering how drastically each item could change its destination. Similarly, the story comes nowhere as strange and
wonderful as Her Majesty's madmen, the fourth plot that breaks the wall, for easement to the license of Game of Thrones without a doubt. An essential element for Game of Thrones fansDessed simply, if you're a Game of Thrones fan, this is an essential purchase. It's easily the best game set in George R. R. Martin's
fantasy world, pinching the cloak of the 2014 episodic adventure series by the now-defunct Telltale Games.For Reigns addicts, there's enough new here to keep things fresh, but it also stays true to the DNA of previous games. Personally, I still prefer Reigns: Her Majesty's out-of-the-ordinary rarity, though you could (and
should) pick up both games for less than $7 on the Play Store.Love both? Stop reading this review immediately, press the button below and queue it to download. When you play Reigns: Game of Thrones, you win or and you'll love it every minute. Google Play: Download Reigns: Game of Thrones Thrones Thrones
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