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Identify the area of accounting that is most involved in each of the following responsibilities.

Dana Matthews is the president of Sportswear Company, a manufacturer of hats and sweaters for fans of various professional sports teams. Imagine being the accountant responsible for all the accounting functions at Sportswear. Dana has just reviewed the financial statements for the most recent financial year for the first time and has the following conversation with you:
Learning Objective Compare characteristics of financial and management accounting. Question: The issue facing the president at Sportswear is a common issue. Companies prefer not to provide more information than is required by U.S. GAAP, but they want to have more detailed information for internal decision-making and performance evaluation purposes. That is why it is
important to distinguish between financial and administrative accounting. What is the difference between information prepared by financial auditors and information prepared by auditors? Answer: Financial accounting Provides historical financial information to external users. focuses on providing historical financial information to external users. External users are those outside the
company, including owners (e.g. shareholders) and creditors (e.g. banks or bondholders). Financial accountants who report to external users are required to follow the US. Generally accepted accounting principles (U.S. GAAP)A set of accounting rules that must be followed to provide consistency in reporting financial information to third-party users., a set of accounting rules that
requires consistency in recording and reporting financial information. This information typically summarizes the overall operating results and does not provide detailed information. Management accountingFocus focuses on internal users, including executives, product managers, sales managers and other staff in the organization who use accounting information for decision
making. focuses on internal users: executives, product managers, sales managers, and all other employees within the organization who use accounting information to make important decisions. Management accounting information does not have to be consistent with U.S. GAAP. In fact, compliance with U.S. GAAP can be a deterrent to obtaining useful information for internal
decision-making purposes. For example, when compiling inventory costs for one or more units of product (each sweater or hat produced at Sportswear Company), U.S. GAAP requires that the cost of production costs, such as factory rent and factory costs, be included. For internal decision-making purposes, however, make more sense to include non-production costs directly
related to the product, such as sales commissions or administrative costs. Question: It is clear that financial accounting focuses on reporting to external users, while management accounting focuses on reporting to indoor users. What specifics would we expect in management accounting information? Answer: Management accounting often focuses on making future forecasts for
segments of a business. Let's say Sportswear Company is considering introducing a new line of coffee mugs with team logos on each mug. Management would certainly need detailed financial forecasts for sales, costs and resulting profits (or losses). While historical financial accounting data from other product lines would be useful, preparing projections for the new line of mugs
would be a managerial accounting function. Another feature of management accounting data is the high level of detail. As noted in the opening dialogue between the President and the Accountant of Sportswear Company, the financial information in the annual report provides a general overview of the company's financial results, but does not provide detailed information about
each product. Information, such as product retability, would come from the management accounting function. Finally, administrative accounting information often takes the form of non-financial measures. For example, Sportswear Company can measure the percentage of defective products or the percentage of on-time deliveries to customers. This type of non-financial information
comes from the managerial accounting function. Table 1.1 Comparison of financial and administrative accounts gives an overview of the characteristics of both management and financial accounts. Table 1.1 Comparison of Financial and Managerial Accounting Managerial Accounting Financial Accounting Users Inside the organization Outside the organization Accounting rules
None U.S. Generally Accepted Accounting Principles (U.S. GAAP) Time horizon Future projections (sometimes historical as in detail) Historical information Detail level Often presents segments of an organization (e.g. products, divisions, divisions) Presents general business information in accordance with U.S. GAAP Performance Measures Financial and non-financial demand :
What has the President of Sportswear Company learned about the profitability of the product of the information provided by the executive accountant? Answer: The president of Sportswear, Dana Matthews, learned that the hats product line was much more profitable than expected, accounting for 55 percent of the company's profits, although initial estimates were that the hat
segment would account for 40 percent of the company's profits. Conversely, the sweaters product line was much less profitable than expected, accounting for 45 percent of the company's profits. There are many problems with determining the profitability of the product, including how to allocate costs that are not easily traced back to each product and product revenue and cost
information is accurate enough to make important management decisions. These important issues will be addressed throughout the Key Takeaway Financial accounting provides historical financial information for third-party users in accordance with U.S. GAAP. The administrative accounts provide detailed financial and non-financial information for internal users who use the
information for decision-making, planning and control purposes. Let's say you're the co-owner and manager of a store that sells and repairs mountain bikes. Give an example of a financial accounting report that would be useful to you and your co-owner. Give two examples of management accounting reports that would be useful to you as a manager. Give two examples of non-
financial measures used by a pizza restaurant that serves food in the restaurant and offers delivery services. For each report in the following report, indicate whether it is financial or administrative accounting. Put the reasoning behind your answer for each item. Expected net income for the next quarter by Division Defective Goods produced as a percentage of all produced goods
Earnings account for the most current year, prepared in accordance with U.S. GAAP Monthly Sales broken down by geographic region Production department budget for the next quarter Balance sheet at the end of the current year, prepared in accordance with U.S. GAAP Solution to revise issue 1.1 Financial accounting reports provided to owners typically include the income
account , overview of the equity, balance sheet and state of cash flows. All are prepared in accordance with U.S. GAAP. Management accounting reports prepared for managers can include a quarterly budget for revenue and expenses for each segment of the business (for example, bike sales and bike repairs), returns for defective goods as one percent of total monthly sales,
revenue forecasts used in deciding to open a new store, and expected sales for each bike model. (There are many correct answers to this problem. Use Table 1.1 Comparison of financial and administrative accounts as a guide to determining the accuracy of your answer.) Examples of non-financial measures include percentage of on-time deliveries, percentage of burned pizzas,
average time needed to prepare pizza for restaurant customers (from taking a customer's order to delivering the pizza to the customer's table), and results of customer satisfaction surveys. (These are just a few examples. There are many correct answers to this problem.) The answers are displayed as follows. Make sure you've explained your answers. Management accounting
information is for future projections and includes segments of the administration the manager's non-financial detailed measurement of defective products Financial accounting — historical information prepared in accordance with the U.S. GAAP managerial accounting records — detailed information provided monthly on the accounting of managerial data — information is for future
projections and includes a segment segment the Company Financial Accounting — Historical Information prepared in accordance with the U.S. GAAP Learning Objective Describe the planning and control functions performed by managers. Question: Managers of most organizations are constantly planning for the future, and after the plan is implemented, managers assess
whether they have achieved their goals. What are the two functions that enable management to implement the process of continuous planning and evaluation? Answer: The two key functions that enable management to continually assess plans for the future and implementation are called planning and control. PlanningThe process of setting goals and communicating these goals
to employees of the organization. is the process of setting goals and communicating these goals to employees of the organization. The auditThe process to evaluate whether the organization's plans were effectively implemented. function is the process of evaluating whether the organization's plans have been effectively implemented. Question: Constantly planning for the future is
an important quality of many successful organizations, such as Southwest Airlines (discussed in Note 1.11 Business in Action 1.1). How do organizations formalize their strategic plans? Answer: Organizations formalize their plans by budgetA set of reports used to quantify an organization's plan for the future., a series of reports used to quantify an organization's plans for the
future. For example, Ernst &amp; Young, an international accounting firm, plans for the future by setting a budget that indicates the working hours needed to perform specific services for each customer. The process of creating a budget for each customer allows the company to plan for future workforce needs and communicate these needs to company employees. Instead of
hoping that it all will work out in the end, Ernst &amp; Young projects the working hours needed in the future, hires accounting staff based on these forecasts and plans the staff needed for each customer. A budget can take different forms. A budgeted profit and loss account indicates a profit plan for the future. A capital budget shows the long-term investments planned for the
future. A cash flow budget outlines the cash inflows and outflows for the future. In later chapters, we'll provide more information on how budgets can be used for planning purposes. Plans for the Future Review's annual report or 10K for just about any company, and you are likely to find information about the plans for Future. Here are some examples: Southwest Airlines. A low-fare,
short-haul carrier that focuses on business commuters and vacationers states in its annual report, we are focused on four major initiatives: the AirTran integration, the All-New Rapid Rewards program, the addition of the Boeing 737-800 in 2012, and the replacement of our our System. Sears Holdings Corporation. A multiline retailer that offers a wide range of merchandise and
related services states in its 10K report, we will continue to invest in our online properties. By integrating our extensive store network with our online properties, we believe Sears Holdings will succeed in the rapidly evolving retail environment. Nordstrom, Inc. A fashion specialty retailer indicates in its 10K report that its strategic growth plan includes opening new Nordstrom full-line
and Nordstrom Rack stores, with 6 announced Nordstrom full-line and 18 announced Nordstrom Rack store openings, the majority of which will take place in 2012. As these companies go through the process of making decisions about the future, developing plans based on their decisions and monitoring the implementation of their plans, management accounting information will
play an important role in all phases of the process. Question: While planning for the future is important, plans are only effective if executed properly. How do organisations assess the implementation of their plans? Answer: The audit function evaluates whether an organization's plans have been implemented effectively and often leads to recommendations for the future. Many
organizations compare actual results with the original plan (or budget) to evaluate the performance of employees, departments, or the entire organization. For example, suppose Ernst &amp; Young creates a budget that specifies the working hours needed to perform tax services for a particular customer (this is the scheduling function). After the work is completed, the actual
working hours are used to complete the work compared to budgeted working hours. This analysis is then used to assess whether employees were able to complete the work within the budgeted time and often results in recommendations for the future. Recommendations may include the need to add more work hours to the budget or obtain better customer support documents.
Operation planning and monitoring are essential functions across most organizations. In today's business environment, effective management planning and control can be the key to survival. Key Takeaway Managers constantly plan and monitor operations within organizations. Planning includes setting goals and communicating these goals to organization employees. The audit
function assesses whether goals have been achieved and is often used to evaluate the performance of employees, departments, and the organization as a whole. Let's say you're preparing a personal budget of all income and expenses for next month. Describe planning and control functions this process. What benefits can be gained from performing the planning and control
functions for a personal budget? Problem 1.2 Problem 1.2 The planning feature would include setting revenue and expense targets for next month. withhold. sources of income are wages, scholarships, or student loans. Costs can include rent, textbooks, tuition, food, entertainment and transportation. The audit function takes place after the end of the month and includes comparing
actual income and expenses with budgeted income and expenses. This makes it possible to assess whether the benefit and burden targets have been achieved. There are several advantages to using a planning and control process. The planning function sets income and expense targets and helps identify any deviations from these goals. For example, the planned expenditure is
clearly described in the budget and provides guidance for spending decisions during the month. Without clear guidelines, money can be spent on items that are not needed. The control feature allows an evaluation of how well you have achieved the goals set in the planning process. Perhaps some goals were achieved (for example, food spending was close to what was
budgeted), while others did not (for example, transportation spending was higher than what was budgeted). The control function identifies these areas and leads to sophisticated goals in the future. For example, the decision could be made to carpool next month to save on transportation costs or to earn more revenue to pay for transportation by working extra hours. Learning
objective Describe the functions of the most important financial and accounting staff. Question: From the previous discussion, we know that planning and control features are often designed to evaluate the performance of an organization's employees and departments. This often also applies to employees who monitor financial information. For example, it is important to understand
how most large companies organize their accounting and financial staff. What are the accounting and financial functions within a typical large company and what functions do they perform? Answer: Let's look at an example to answer this question. Suppose you are the president of Sportswear Company, mentioned earlier in the chapter, who produces hats and jerseys for fans of
professional sports teams. Let's say this is a big public company. (The term public companyA company whose shares are publicly traded. As president of Sportswear, ask the following questions: How much do we owe the government on income tax for the year? What was the total net profit for the last financial year? Should we expand into new geographic markets? If we decide
to expand into new markets, we must obtain financing by issuing bonds, obtaining a loan from a bank or releasing ordinary shares How profitable is each segment of our business (hats and sweaters)? How effective are our internal controls on cash? The challenge is to determine who Sportswear would be best suited to answer any of these questions. An organization chart helps
you find a solution. Figure 1.1 A typical organization chart is a typical organization chart; it shows how accounting and financial staff fit within most companies. The staff at the bottom of the chart report to the above. For example, the managing auditor reports to the controller. At the top of the chart are those who control the company, usually the board of directors (which are
chosen by the owners or shareholders). View Figure 1.1 A typical organization chart before proceeding with the detailed discussion of each important financial and accounting position. Figure 1.1 A typical organization chart *Represents vice presidents from various departments outside of accounting and finance, such as manufacturing, personnel and research and development.
**In addition to reporting to the chief financial officer, the internal auditor typically independently reports to the Board of Directors and/or the audit committee (consisting of selected members of the Board of Directors). The chief financial officer (CFO)The person responsible for all financial and accounting functions within the organization. is responsible for all financial and accounting
functions of the organization and typically reports to the chief executive officer. The controllerThe person responsible for managing the accounting staff who provides managerial accounting information used for internal decision-making, financial accounting information for external reporting purposes and tax accounting information to meet tax return requirements. is responsible for
the management of accounting staff providing managerial accounting information used for internal decision-making, financial accounting information for external reporting purposes and tax accounting information to meet tax return requirements. The three accountants that the controller manages are as follows: Managerial accountant. The leading accountantThe person who helps
to prepare information that is used for decision-making within the organization. reports directly to the controller and helps prepare information used for decision-making within the organization. Reports prepared by managing auditors include operating budgets, cost estimates for existing products, budgets for new product lines, and profit and loss reports by division. (Please note
that some people use the term cost accountant interchangeable with the executive accountant. Others consider costing a specific function of management accounting that focuses on measuring costs. In this text, we use the term executive accountant and assume that cost accountants focus on measuring costs.) Financial accountant. The financial auditorThe person who helps
prepare financial information in accordance with U.S. GAAP for external users. reports directly to the and helps prepare financial information, in accordance with U.S. GAAP, for people outside the company. Reports prepared by financial auditors include a quarterly report filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC) that is called a 10Q and an annual report filed with
the SEC, which is called a 10K. Tax auditor. The tax accountantThe person who helps prepare tax reports for government agencies. reports directly to the controller and helps prepare tax reports for government agencies, including the IRS. The TreasurerThe person responsible for obtaining funding, projecting cash flow needs, and managing cash and short-term investments for
the organization. reports directly to the CFO. The primary tasks of a treasurer include obtaining sources of funding for the organisation (e.g. from banks and shareholders), projecting cash flow needs and managing cash and short-term investments. An internal auditorThe person responsible for confirming that the controls within the company are effective in ensuring accurate
financial data. reports to the CFO and is responsible for confirming that the company has audits that ensure accurate financial information. The internal auditor often verifies the financial information provided by the manager, financial and tax auditors (all of whom report to the controller and ultimately to the CFO). If conflicts arise with the CFO, an internal auditor can report directly
to the Board of Directors or to the audit committee, which consists of selected board members. Question: The organization chart in Figure 1.1 A typical organization chart is intended as a guide. However, all organizations are not the same, especially smaller organizations. How can the organizational structure differ for a small organization? Answer: Smaller organizations typically
have only one or two key financial and accounting employees performing the previously described functions. For example, one accountant can carry out the financial and managerial accounting tasks, while another accountant takes care of the tax work (or the tax work can be outsourced to a tax office). Instead of hiring its own internal auditor, an organization can hire one from an
external consulting firm. Some organizations may not have a CFO or may have a CFO, but they may not have a controller. An organization's structure depends on many different factors, including size and reporting requirements, as indicated in the Note 1.23 Business in Action 1.2. The organisational structure of a Symphony Financial constraints prevent a small not-for-profit
symphony in California from hiring full-time finance and accounting workers. Despite the fact that annual income is nearly $200,000, all financial transactions are processed and recorded by a part-time accountant hired by the symphony. The accountant also financial information and provides monthly financial reports to the Treasurer. The Treasurer, a voluntary member of the
Board of Directors, is responsible for drawing up the annual budget and providing monthly financial reports to the Board of Directors. An external company prepares and processes all tax returns, collects annual accounts and carries out an overview of the accounting transactions at the end of each financial year. Note how the symphony has none of the formal positions identified in
Figure 1.1 A typical organization chart, with the exception of the Treasurer. This illustrates how financial constraints and reporting requirements can require an organization to be creative in determining its organizational structure. Key Takeaway It is important to understand the most important accounting and financial positions within a typical company and how each position fits
into the organizational structure. The chief financial officer (CFO) oversees all accounting and financial staff, including the controller, treasurer and internal auditor. The controller is responsible for the managerial, financial and fiscal accounting staff. For each of the six questions listed at the beginning of this section for Sportswear Company, you determine who within the company
would be responsible for providing the right information. Let's say Sportswear has the same organizational structure as in Figure 1.1 A Typical Organization Chart. Solution for Review Problem 1.3 The tax accountant is responsible for determining the income tax to be paid to different government agencies. The financial auditor prepares the annual report, which takes out the profit
and loss account where net income can be found. Although it is likely to involve several staff members, the manager's accountant is responsible for providing financial forecasts. However, the financial auditor may provide historical information for existing geographic segments, which would form the basis for the senior auditor's estimates. The Treasurer makes funding decisions.
Detailed financial information that goes beyond what is required by U.S. GAAP may be provided by the lead auditors. The internal auditors are responsible for evaluating the effectiveness of internal controls. Learn to use objective standards of ethical behavior to resolve ethical conflicts faced by auditors. Suppose you're the accountant for Drive Write, a company that
manufactures computer disk drives, and you're responsible for all accounting functions within the company. The has let you know that if the company's profits grow by 20 percent this year, you will receive a $20,000 bonus, and they will receive a $50,000 bonus. No bonuses are awarded if the profit growth is less than 20 percent. As the company's profits have increased by 20
percent annually over the past 10 years, investors are investors significant growth from year to year. By the end of this fiscal year, the president and you have the following conversation: Ask: The situation at Drive Write creates a serious ethical dilemma. (The Drive Write example is based on a real company called MiniScribe Corporation, then purchased by a competitor.)
Companies are under constant pressure to meet revenue and profit targets. Employees who succeed in achieving these goals often reap huge financial rewards; those who fail may be penalised with lower pay or may even lose their jobs. What would you do if you were asked to capture information in a way that distorts the company's financial results? Answer: As the accountant
for Drive Write, your response to the president's request would likely affect your reputation as a professional and your future as an accountant. The unethical behaviour at companies such as Xerox, Enron and WorldCom in recent years makes it necessary that we know how to act both ethically and how to resolve ethical conflicts. To help accounting professionals through ethical
dilemmas such as those at Drive Write, the Institute of Management Accountants (IMA) has prepared a Statement of Ethical Professional Practice, which appears in Figure 1.2 IMA Statement of Ethical Professional Practice. The standards set out in this statement are guidelines that can help auditors choose an ethically acceptable course of action. As you review Figure 1.2 IMA
Statement of Ethical Professional Practice, note that the IMA specifies four core responsibilities (competence, confidentiality, integrity, and credibility) and guidelines for resolving ethical conflicts. The Ethical Conflict Resolution section provides specific guidelines for resolving the conflict at Drive Write. Figure 1.2 IMA Statement of Ethical Professional Practice Question: The IMA is
just one of many professional accounting organizations. Do other professional accounting firms also provide accounting ethics guidelines? Answer: Yes, other professional organizations do offer ethical guidance. Some find as follows: The American Institute for Certified Public Accountants (AICPA) has a Code of Conduct (see ). Financial Executives International offers a Code of
Ethical Conduct for Financial Managers (see ). The International Federation of Accountants has a Code of Ethics and Statement of Policy Implementation &amp; Enforcement of Ethical Requirements (see ). The Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC), in accordance with the Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002, requires a company to disclose whether it has a code of ethics (see ).
The Institute of Management Accountants even provides an ethical helpline to give financial professionals a resource guidance in making the right decisions (see ). Because of alleged misconduct, such as the one in the Note 1.27 Business in Action 1.3, improving ethics is a top priority for most companies, as shown in the Note 1.28 Business in Action 1.4. As a result, professional
organizations as we have cited have come to play an important role in providing ethical guidelines. Production Firm EmployeesCharged with Fraud The Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC) has filed three claims against Diebold, Inc., a manufacturer and seller of ATMs, for improperly inflating earnings over a five-year period. Three former employees, the CFO, the
controller and the director of accounting, were accused of improperly inflating revenues on factory orders, misidentifying income from a lease transaction, manipulating reserves and overflowing items, falsely capitalizing expenses and falsely increasing the value of the stock. These actions allegedly resulted in more than 40 misstated annual, quarterly, and other reports filed with
the SEC, along with numerous inaccurate press releases. The company agreed to pay a $25 million civil fine, and the three former employees remain in litigation. Although the CEO was not accused of wrongdoing, he settled with the SEC and agreed to pay back cash bonuses, shares, and stock options received during the periods when the financial fraud was committed. The
Code of Ethics at Home Depot and Hewlett-Packard Ethics policies are becoming increasingly important for organizations. Home Depot, Inc., has a code of ethics that provides the basics for employees to align business decisions with how Home Depot works and forms the basis for our ethical behavior. Hewlett-Packard Company has established business ethics led by enduring
values. The company declares its commitment to the following principles: honesty, excellence, responsibility, compassion, citizenship, honesty and respect. Key Takeaway Should you encounter ethical conflicts during your career, use the resources provided by internal corporate policies, by professional organizations such as the IMA and AICPA, and by government organizations
such as the SEC to guide ethical conduct and resolve ethical conflicts. Solution for review problem 1.4 The four main standards in Figure 1.2 IMA Statement of Ethical Professional Practice are described as follows: Competence. IMA members must maintain an adequate level of skill to perform tasks in an accurate and professional manner. Confidentiality. Members of the IMA
may not, for any reason, disclose information, unless required by law to do so. Integrity. Members of the IMA should avoid an actual or apparent conflict of interest, including receiving gifts or favors, and should not engage in any activity that would bring it into disrepute Appeal. Credibility. Members of the IMA must disclose all relevant information fairly and objectively. There are
several options for resolving ethical conflicts. The IMA proposes the following directions of action: Follow the organization's policy on the resolution of ethical conflicts. If following the organization's policies doesn't effectively resolve the conflict, discuss the issue with your immediate supervisor, unless the supervisor is involved. If the direct superior cannot reach a satisfactory
solution, the problem should be presented to the next higher level of management. If not all senior levels of management reach a satisfactory solution, an acceptable review authority can be a group, such as the audit committee, the executive committee, the board of directors, the supervisory board or the owners. Another option is to consult an objective advisor (e.g. IMA ethics
counseling service or a lawyer). There are several options available. The IMA proposes first after the organization's policy regarding the resolution of ethical conflicts. If Drive Write has no policy or if the organization's policies do not resolve the conflict, the next step is to discuss the conflict with the direct supervisor. However, the chairman of Drive Write (the direct supervisor) is
involved in the conflict, so approaching the president's superiors would be best. These can be the audit committee, the executive committee, the board of directors or the owners. If, after pursuing these various actions, the ethical conflict still exists, it may be appropriate to consult an objective advisor (e.g. the IMA helpline) and perhaps consult a lawyer about legal obligations and
rights related to the ethical conflict. (Many would argue that regardless of the outcome, one would not want to work for a company where this kind of unethical behavior occurs at the top, or somewhere within the organization, and that dismissal is the best course of action.) Learning objective Understand how accounting systems can help organizations. Question: Many companies
are growing out of their accounting systems today. Previously, accounting systems were primarily designed to track daily transactions and provide reports to external users on a monthly, quarterly or annual basis. But times have changed and companies now need more information internally to make good decisions. Currently, accounting systems are used for both external
reporting (financial accounting) and internal reporting (management accounting). Even relatively small accounting packages, such as QuickBooks and Peachtree, offer features that are important for management accounting. Most however, agree that no accounting system will meet the needs of each organisation and that two important factors should be considered when choosing
a system. What are the two that should be considered when deciding on an accounting system? Answer: The two factors are (1) the size of the organization and (2) the information needs of the organization. Each factor is then discussed. Accounting software is designed to serve businesses of different sizes. The size of a company is often measured in sales. Experts give
different opinions about what a small, medium or large company is. Some believe that small businesses sell to have $10 million, midsize businesses have sales up to $100 million, and large companies have a turnover greater than $100 million. Others prefer different amounts. Regardless of the number used, the goal is to find an accounting system that best meets the needs of the
organization, and the size of the organization plays a big role in finding the best fit system. Before selecting an accounting system, an organization must determine its accounting needs. Some organizations simply need the equivalent of a check register, which provides easy tracking of expense codes when checks are issued and makes bank reconciliations in an instant. Other
organisations require more than one cheque register; they can require a system that can create invoices, process payroll and track inventory. More complex organizations want the ability to perform more advanced functions. Such organizations may need to customize reports (for example, create a profit and loss account by division or customer), change input screens, send
financial reports by email, export reports to spreadsheet software such as Excel, and create reports with images (for example, tables, pie charts, and line charts). Question: It is clear that the size and information needs of a company will drive the selection of an accounting system for the company. As the need for accounting data has become more complex, accounting systems
have been developed that perform a wide range of tasks. These systems are called enterprise resource planning systems. What is an enterprise resource planning system, and how does this system help companies with the use of accounting data? Answer: Enterprise Resource Planning (ERP) A system designed to record and share information in functional and geographic areas
to meet the needs of internal and external users. systems are designed to record and share information in all functional areas (e.g. accounting, marketing, human resources and shipping) and in different geographic areas (for example, from a sales office in California to its headquarters in Hong Kong). ERP systems work information to provide real-time data to all users, and the
data can be organized in different formats to meet the needs of internal and external users. For example, in his book Onward, Howard Schultz describes how, as CEO of Starbucks, he assesses comparative financial data for Starbucks stores on a daily basis. This information comes from the ERP system at Starbucks. The idea behind ERP ERP and a central theme in
management accounting, is that accurate and up-to-date financial information will help organizations make better decisions. Better decisions tend to lead to improvements in profitability, efficiency and customer satisfaction. ERP systems are expensive. The annual cost for large organizations can easily exceed $10 million. However, smaller systems for medium-sized businesses
are available at much lower cost. Most ERP software is offered in modules for functional accounting areas, such as debtors, debtors, payroll, inventory, and task costs. The more modules included, the higher the cost will be. Popular creators of ERP systems include Microsoft, Oracle and SAP Corporation. When deciding whether or not to upgrade to an ERP system, organizations
need to be sure that the benefits of using a new system's data outweigh the cost of implementing the system. If management does not intend to use the information to improve planning and decision-making, then dealing with a less advanced accounting system may be the better approach. Question: ERP systems often provide a means to download data to spreadsheets for
further analysis. How can spreadsheet software help us analyze financial information? Answer: Since managers make extensive use of spreadsheets to organize and analyze data, most automated accounting systems are designed to export data to spreadsheet software programs such as Excel. For example, Figure 1.3 Excel Spreadsheet for Southwest Airlines shows how a
spreadsheet was used to import data directly from Southwest Airlines' 2010 annual report. This makes it easier for the user to analyze the data. Note that in Figure 1.3 Excel Spreadsheet for Southwest Airlines the total operating income increased over the three years shown. We can use Excel to quickly determine the exact percentage increase from 2008 to 2009 and from 2009
to 2010. Figure 1.3 Excel Spreadsheet for Southwest Airlines Question: Let's assume you're asked to prepare a profit and loss account with earnings and expense forecasts for next year. How to use Excel to prepare your projections? Answer: You start exporting this year's results from the accounting system to an Excel spreadsheet. Then set up a new column to display estimates
for next year. You'd probably discuss different aspects of the profit and loss account with different employees in the organization - making changes as you go - before you aphrodisiac your forecasts. Imagine the work involved if you computer use, but instead had to write down the information by hand. If there were changes to the information, you would make time-consuming
calculations, and once the data are completed, you would be faced with the manual preparation of formal reports. With the relatively recent advances in business technology, the days of preparation manually over. Most organizations require their accounting and financial staff to have advanced computer spreadsheet skills. Our goal is to give you the ability to use spreadsheets in a
way that reflects the real world. Key Takeaway This text teaches you about different methods for capturing, sorting, analyzing, and reporting financial information for internal users. Before you decide to implement any of these methods, ask yourself the following question: Will the benefits that result from a new system, such as an ERP system, exceed the cost of setting up the
system? If the answer is yes, go for it! If the answer is no, consider other alternatives. Let's say you're the CFO of an electronics consulting firm with an annual revenue of $30,000,000 and an annual profit of $5,000,000. The current accounting system is used for basic functions, such as issuing cheques, creating invoices and processing payroll. The company is considering
upgrading its accounting system by purchasing an ERP system. Describe the factors that the company should take into account when making this decision. Solutions for Review Problem 1.5 This company is a medium-sized company with $30 million in revenue, although some would argue that this is a small business. Going to an ERP system is probably not appropriate if
management is just looking for a few reports that go beyond what most financial accounting systems can offer. If management needs more detailed and complex financial information, with the exception of processing checks, invoices and payroll, then a low-end ERP system may be appropriate. However, the benefits of such a system must outweigh the costs. Learning objective
Understand the terms used for costing purposes. Question: Much of what we discuss in this book relates to companies that produce products, such as Nike and Apple, and terminology is an important part of accounting for manufacturing companies. The challenge is to correctly classify the costs for items such as production materials, production work, marketing department work,



rent for production facilities and rent for administrative services facilities. These costs should be carefully classified so that they are correctly reflected in the company's financial reports. The starting point for learning how to classify costs correctly is in understanding two broad categories of costs. What are the two broad terms used to categorize cost information in a production
environment? Answer: The two broad cost categories are production costs non-production costs. Each category is described in detail as follows. All costs related to the production of goods are called production costsAll costs related to the production of goods; also known as product costs.; they are also known as product costsAll costs related to the production of goods; also
known as production costs.. Called.. manufacturer buys materials, uses workers who use the materials to assemble the goods, provides a building where the materials are stored and goods are assembled, and sells the goods. We classify the costs associated with these activities into three categories: direct materials, direct labour and production overhead. To help clarify what
costs are included in these three categories, let's look at a furniture company that specializes in building custom wooden tables called Custom Furniture Company. Each table is unique and built to the customer's specifications for use in homes (coffee tables and dining tables) and offices (boardroom and meeting tables). The retail price of each table varies significantly, from $1,000
to more than $30,000. Figure 1.4 Direct Materials, Direct Labor, and Manufacturing Overhead at Custom Furniture Company shows examples of manufacturing activities at Custom Furniture Company for each of the three categories (we continue to use this company as an example in Chapter 2 How Is Job Costing Used to Track Production Costs?). Question: Raw materials used
in the production process that can be easily traced back to the product are called direct materialsRaw materials that are used in the production process and which can be easily traced back to the product.. What materials used in the manufacturing process at Custom Furniture would be classified as direct materials? Answer: The wood used to build tables and the hardware used to
attach table legs would be considered direct materials. Small, inexpensive items such as glue, nails and masking tape are usually not included in direct materials because the cost of tracing these items to the product outweighs the benefit of having accurate cost data. These small types of materials, often called supplies or indirect materials, are included in the production
overhead, which we later define. Question: Employees who convert materials into a finished product and whose time can be easily traced back to the product are directly called laborLabor which is performed by employees who convert materials into a finished product and whose time can be easily traced back to the product.. Who stands for direct labor at Custom Furniture?
Answer: Direct labor would allow workers who use the wood, hardware, glue, lacquer, and other materials to build tables. Question: All costs related to the production process, with the exception of direct material and direct labour costs, are called production costsAll costs related to the production process, except direct material costs and direct Terms synonymous with production
overhead include factory overhead, factory load, and overhead. What items are included in the production overhead? Answer: Production overhead consists of: Indirect material costsThe cost of materials required to manufacture a product that is not easily traced back to the product or that is not not trace to the product.. The cost of materials needed to manufacture a product that
is not easily traced back to the product or not worth tracing to the product. Indirect labour costsThe costs of employees involved in the production process, but whose time cannot be easily traced back to the product.. The costs of workers involved in the production process, but whose time cannot be easily traced back to the product. For example, supervisors in the manufacturing
process who oversee various products and are responsible for hiring employees, planning employees, and ordering materials are considered indirect labor. Other production costs. These are all other costs for items related to the plant, including equipment maintenance, insurance, utilities, and depreciation. Table 1.2 Production Costs at Custom Furniture Company provides some
examples of production costs at Custom Furniture Company by category. Table 1.2 Production Costs at Custom Furniture Company Direct Materials Wood: Cherry, Maple, Oak and Mahogany Hardware: Tray Covers Direct Labor Workers Who Cut, Airplane and Glue Wood Workers Who Fill And Sand Tables Workers Who Stain and Finish Tables Manufacturing Indirect Materials:
Glue, Screws, Nails, Sandpaper, Stain, and Lacquer Indirect Labor: Factory Supervisors Other Production Costs: Equipment Maintenance, Equipment Depreciation, Factory Utilities , factory insurance, depreciation in factory buildings and property taxes at the factory Note 1.43 Business in Action 1.5 describes the materials, labor and production overhead at a company that
produces boats since 1968. Production costs at MasterCraft MasterCraft produces boats for water skiers and wakeboarders. Each boat produced entails significant production costs. MasterCraft records these production costs as an inventory on the balance sheet until the boats are sold, at which point the costs are transferred to the cost of goods sold in the profit and loss
account. Examples of direct materials for each boat are the hull, engine, transmission, carpet, meters, seats, windshield and swimming platform. Examples of indirect materials (part of the production overhead) are glue, paint and screws. Direct labor involves the production workers who assemble and test the boats before they are shipped. Indirect labor (part of production
overhead) includes production supervisors who oversee production for different boats and product lines. Production overhead includes the indirect materials and indirect labor mentioned earlier. Other production overhead items are the building rental, maintenance and depreciation for manufacturing equipment, factory utilities, and quality control testing. Costs unrelated to the
production of goods shall be referred to as non-cost costs associated with the production of goods; goods; term costs are mentioned.; they are also known as period costs not related to the production of goods; also known as non-manufacturer's costs.. These costs have two components - selling costs and general and administrative costs - which are then described. Examples of
non-manufacturers can be seen in Figure 1.5 Examples of non-manufacturer costs at Custom Furniture Company. Demand: Charges incurred to obtain customer orders and provide customers with a finished product are called selling costs incurred to obtain customer orders and deliver customers a finished product.. (They are also often referred to as marketing or selling and
advertising costs.) What activities would be classified as selling costs at Custom Furniture? Answer: Examples of selling costs include advertising, sales commissions, salaries for marketing and advertising staff, office space for marketing and advertising staff, storage costs for finished products, and shipping costs paid by the seller for products sent to customers. Question: Costs
associated with the overall management of an organization are called general and administrative costsCosts related to the overall management of an organization.. What activities would be classified as general and administrative expenses at Custom Furniture? Answer: Examples are staff and support staff in the following areas: accounting, human resources, legal, executive and
information technology. The depreciation of office equipment and buildings in relation to these areas would also be recognised as general and administrative costs. General and administrative costs are often referred to simply as administrative costs. Figure 1.5 Examples of non-manufacturer costs at Custom Furniture Company Although selling and general and administrative
expenses are considered non-manufacturer fees, managers often want to assign a portion of these costs to products for decision-making purposes. For example, sales commissions and shipping costs for a specific product can be assigned to the product. This does not comply with U.S. GAAP because, under U.S. GAAP, only product costs can be assigned to products. However,
as we noted earlier, management accounting information is tailored to meet the needs of users and does not need to follow U.S. GAAP. Distinguishing between production and non-production costs is not always easy. For example, if legal staff are working on a problem related to production staff and employing assembly line workers, are the costs of production or non-
manufacturing costs? is up to each organization to determine how such costs should be processed for product costing purposes. The advantage of management accounting over financial accounting is that costs can be organized in any way that helps managers make decisions. In this chapter, however, in order to avoid ambiguity, we follow the definitions definitions by U.S.
GAAP. Question: At this point, you should be able to distinguish between production costs and non-production costs. Why is it important to make this distinction? Answer: Distinguishing between the two categories is crucial because the category determines where a cost is displayed in the financial statements. All production costs (direct materials, direct labour and production
overhead) are attached to the inventory as an asset on the balance sheet until the goods are sold, after which the costs are transferred to the cost of goods sold as an expense in the profit and loss account. As we mentioned earlier, non-manufacturer costs are also referred to as period costs; that's because they are exchanged on the profit and loss account during the period in
which they are created. Table 1.3 Manufacturing Versus Nonmanufacturing Costs clarifies the relationship between production costs and non-production costs. It also describes the point at which these costs are recorded as costs on the profit and loss account. (Remember that the terms production costs and product costs are interchangeable, as are the terms non-production
costs and period costs.) Table 1.3 Production versus non-production costs Production costs (also called product costs) Non-production costs (also called period costs) Direct materials Direct labour Production costs General and administrative timing of costs: Costs are taken into account when goods are sold. Timing of costs: Fees will be charged during the period incurred. Note
1.48 Business in Action 1.6 provides examples of non-production costs at PepsiCo, Inc. Non-production costs at PepsiCo PepsiCo, Inc., produces more than 500 products under various brand names, including Frito-Lay, Pepsi-Cola, Gatorade, Tropicana and Quaker. Net sales for 2010 were $57,800,000,000, resulting in an operating profit of $6,300,000,000. The selling costs
represented the highest profit and loss expense account of $26,600,000,000. The second highest costs in the profit and loss account - sales and general and administrative expenses - were $22,800,000,000. These costs are period costs, which means they must be paid in the period in which they are incurred. Examples of selling costs for PepsiCo include television advertising
(probably the largest chunk of the $22,800,000,000), promotional coupons, product shipping costs to customers, and salaries of marketing and advertising staff. Examples of general and administrative expenses include salaries and bonuses of top managers and the costs of administrative departments, including staff, accounting, legal and information technology. Key Takeaway
All production costs that can be easily traced back to a classified as direct materials or direct labour. All other production costs are classified as production overhead. All non-manufacturer costs are not and are classified as selling or general and administrative costs. The following production items are for a construction company working on several custom homes. Determine
whether each item should be categorized as direct materials, direct labor or production overhead. Nails Wood Drywall Workers building the house frame Supervisor responsible for three homes Light bulbs Cabinets Depreciation of building material Identify whether each item in the following should be categorized as a product (production) cost or as period (non-production) costs.
Also specify whether the cost should be recorded as a charge when the cost is incurred or as an expense when the goods are sold. Ad Shipping costs for raw materials derived from a supplier Shipping costs for goods sent to a customer's salary Chief executive officer's salary The salary of the supervisor depreciation on manufacturing equipment Raw materials used in production
Paper used by accounting staff Commissions paid to vendors Concierge services provided for production facility Deliveries used by staff Utility costs for store Insurance costs for production assembly line workers Administrative support for chief executive officer Maintenance of production equipment Identify whether any article listed in Article 2 must be categorized as direct
materials, direct labour, production overhead, selling or general and administrative expenses. Solution for Assessment Problem 1.6 Production overhead Direct materials Direct materials Direct labor Production overhead Production overhead (You could call this a direct material, but the benefit of keeping this item as a direct material probably does not outweigh the cost.) Direct
Materials Production overhead Period of costs, costs charged when incurred Product costs, cost at sale of goods Period cost, cost when incurred Period cost, cost when incurred Product costs, costs when goods are sold Product costs, costs when goods are sold Product costs, costs at the sale of goods Are sold Period costs, costs charged when incurred period costs, costs
when incurred Product costs , costs when goods are sold Period costs, costs charged at incurred period, costs charged when incuring product costs, cost in selling goods Product costs, cost incurred product costs, costs when goods are sold Sales direct material or production costs, depending on whether the materials traceable to the product (direct) or non-(indirect production
overhead) Sales general and administrative manufacturing costs Production overhead Direct materials or production costs, depending on whether the materials can be easily traced back to the product (directly) or not (indirect manufacturing overhead) General and administrative sales production sales production General and administrative sales production overhead General and
Administrative Manufacturing overhead Learning Objective Identify how costs flow through the three inventory accounts and account the cost of goods sold. Question: Custom Furniture Company's direct materials include items such as wood and hardware. Direct labor includes the workers who build the custom tables. Production overhead includes items such as indirect materials
(glue, screws, nails, sandpaper, and stain), indirect labor (production supervisor), and other production costs, such as maintenance of factory equipment and factory utilities. What accounts are used to record the costs of these items and where are these accounts displayed in the financial statements? Answer: All the aforementioned costs for custom furniture are product costs
(also called production costs). Product costs are recorded as an asset on the balance sheet until the products are sold, after which the costs are recorded as an expense on the profit and loss account. To register product costs as an asset, auditors use one of three inventory accounts: raw material inventory, work in process inventory or stock end products. The account they use
depends on the product's completion level. They use one expense account - cost of goods sold - to record the product cost when the goods are sold. Table 1.4 Accounts used to include product costs provide an overview of the accounts used to track product costs. Figure 1.6 Flow of Product Costs through Balance and Income Statement Accounts shows how product costs flow
through the balance sheet and the profit and loss account. Finally, Note 1.57 Business in Action 1.7 provides an example of how the accounts in Table 1.4 Accounts used to record product costs and Figure 1.6 Flow of product expenses through balance sheet and profit and loss accounts appear in the financial statements. Take the time to review these items carefully. Your
understanding of them will help clarify how product costs flow through the accounts and where product costs appear in the financial statements. The next discussion provides further clarification. Question: What is the difference between raw material inventory, work-in-process inventory and stock of finished products? Answer: Each of these accounts is used to record product
costs, depending on where the product is in the production process, and each account is an asset account on the balance sheet. The raw material inventoryA account used to record the cost of materials that have not yet been put into production. account records the cost of materials that have not yet been put into production. For Custom Furniture Company, this contains items
such as wood, brackets, screws, nails, glue, lacquer, and sandpaper. The work-in-process (WIP) inventoryA account used to capture product costs in the production process are not yet complete. account records the cost of products that have not yet been completed. Suppose Custom Furniture Company has eight tables that are still in production at the end of the year. All
production costs associated with these incomplete eight tables, direct materials, direct labor and production overhead are included in the WIP inventory account. Once goods in wip inventory are completed, they are transferred to the inventory of finished goods. The costs of completed goods transferred from the WIP inventory to the inventory of finished goods shall be called the
costs of manufactured goodsThe cost of completed goods transferred from the inventory of finished goods.. The stock of finished productsAn account used to record production costs associated with products that are completed and ready to sell. account records the production costs of products that are completed and ready to sell. Let's say custom furniture company has five
completed tables at the end of the year (in addition to the eight partially completed tables in the work-in-process inventory). The production costs of these five tables (direct materials, direct labour and production overhead) are included in the stock account final products until the tables are sold. (For the purposes of applying this example, consider that the tables are sold when
they are delivered to the customer.) Question: The cost of materials that have not yet been put into production is included in the raw material inventory. The costs associated with products that are not yet complete are included in the WIP inventory. And the costs associated with products that are completed and ready to sell are included in the inventory of finished goods. What
happens to the product costs in stock products when the products are sold? Answer: When completed goods are sold, their costs are transferred from the stock of finished products into the cost of goods soldA expense account in the profit and loss account representing the product costs for all goods sold during the period. Account. Cost of goods sold is an expense account in the
profit and loss account that represents the product costs of all goods sold during the period. For example, suppose Custom Furniture Company sells one table that costs $3,000 to produce (i.e. direct materials, direct labor, and overhead production costs to produce the table total of $3,000). The $3,000 cost is in finished goods inventory until the listing is made to include sales, at
which point finished goods inventory is reduced by $3,000 (the table is longer in stock) and the cost of goods sold is increased by $3,000. Table 1.4 Accounts used to record product costs Account Name Description Financial Overview Raw Material Inventory Cost of Unused Production Materials Balance Sheet (active) Work-in-process stock Cost of incomplete products Balance
sheet (asset) Finished products Cost of completed products not yet sold Balance Sheet (active) Cost of goods sold Cost of products sold Profit and loss account (expense) Figure 1.6 Flow of product costs through balance sheet and profit and loss accounts Presentation of product costs at Advanced Micro Devices Advanced Micro Devices (AMD), a manufacturer of
microprocessors and flash memory devices for personal and networked computers, has an annual turnover of $6,500,000,000. A summarized version of AMD's balance sheet appears as follows (all amounts are in millions). Note that three inventory accounts, totaling $632,000,000, support the total inventory amount displayed in the asset portion of the balance sheet. The raw
material inventory account ($28,000,000) is used to capture the cost of materials that are not yet in production. The work-in-process inventory account ($441,000,000) is used to capture costs associated with microprocessors and flash memory devices in the production process that are not yet complete. The stock account finished products ($163,000,000) are used to include the
product costs associated with AMD products that are completed and ready to sell. When AMD sells finished products, the cost of these goods is transferred from the stock of finished products into the cost of the goods account sold, which this company calls the selling costs, as many companies do. The operational portion of AMD's profit and loss account follows – again, all
amounts are in millions. Note that the selling costs are lower than the net sales and especially the other operating expenses. Key Takeaway The raw material stock account is used to record the cost of materials that are not yet in production. The work-in-process inventory account is used to record the cost of products that are in production but have not yet been completed. The
stock account end products are used to record the costs of products that are complete and ready for sale. These three inventory accounts are asset accounts that appear on the balance sheet. The cost of the goods sold shall be recorded in the cost of goods sold. This account is displayed in the profit and loss account as an expense. Combine each of the following accounts with
the correct description that follows. _____ Raw material inventory _____ Work-in-process inventory ___ Stock of finished products _____ Cost of goods sold Used to record product costs of goods completed and ready to sell Used to capture product costs of goods sold Used to record product costs of goods still in production Used to record the cost of materials not yet in
production Solutions to Assess Problem 1.7 Learning Objective Describe how to prepare an earnings statement for a production company. Question: Companies that provide services, such as Ernst &amp; Young (accounting) and Accenture LLP (consulting), do not sell goods and therefore have no stock. Accounting accounts and the profit and loss account for service companies
are relatively simple. Merchandising companies (also called retail companies) such as Macy's and Home Depot buy and sell goods, but usually don't manufacture goods. Since merchandising companies have to take into account the purchase and sale of goods, their accounting systems are more complex than those of service companies. Production companies such as Johnson
&amp; Johnson and Honda Motor Company produce and sell goods. Such undertakings need an accounting system that goes far beyond accounting, solely for the purchase and sale of goods. Why are accounting systems more complex for production companies? Answer: Accounting systems are more complex for production companies because they need a system that tracks
production costs throughout the production process to the point where goods are sold. Since the profit statements for production companies are usually more complex than for service or merchandising companies, we devote this section to profit and loss accounts for production companies. Understanding profit and loss accounts in a production institution starts with the inventory
cost flow comparison. Question: How do companies use the cost flow equation to calculate unknown balances? Answer: We can use the basic cost flow equation to calculate unknown balances for just about any balance sheet account (for example, cash, debtors, and inventory). The equation is as follows: Key Equation Beginning balance (BB) + Transfers in (TI) – Ending balance
(EB) = Transfers out (TO) We will apply this comparison to the three inventory assets accounts previously discussed (raw materials, work in process and finished goods) to calculate the cost of raw materials used in production, the cost of manufactured goods and the cost of goods sold. Raw materials used in production show the cost of direct and indirect materials placed in the
production process. Cost of manufactured goods represents the cost of goods completed and transferred from work-in-process (WIP) inventory into finished goods inventory. Cost of goods sold represents the cost of goods sold and transferred from the inventory of finished goods in the cost of the goods sold. Auditors need all these amounts — raw materials placed in production,
costs of goods produced and costs of goods sold – to prepare a profit and loss account for a production company. We describe how to calculate these amounts using three formal schedules in the following order: Schedule of raw materials placed in the production Schedule of the cost of goods Schedule of the cost of goods sold Demand: The basic cost flow equation can be used
in three supporting schemes to help us determine the cost of goods sold amount on the profit and loss account for production companies. What information is included in these schemes, and what do they look like for Custom Furniture Company? Answer: Figure 1.7 1.7 Statement Schedules for Custom Furniture Company shows these three schedules for Custom Furniture
Company for the month of May. When viewing these schedules, keep in mind that each schedule contains information necessary for the next schedule, as indicated by the arrows. Remember that the inventory cost comparison is used for each schedule. This is why you see abbreviations for each element of the equation: initial balance (BB), transfers in (TI), final balance (EB) and
transfers (TO). The purpose of going through the process shown in Figure 1.7 Income Statement Schedules for Custom Furniture Company is to arrive at a cost of goods sold amount, which is presented on the profit and loss account. Custom Furniture Company income statement for the month ended May 31 is shown in Figure 1.8 Profit and loss account for Custom Furniture
Company. If you look at Figure 1.7 Income Statement Schedules for Custom Furniture Company and Figure 1.8 Income Statement for Custom Furniture Company, look back at Figure 1.6 Flow of product costs through balance sheet and profit and loss accounts to see how costs flow through the three inventory accounts and the cost of goods sold. In Chapter 2 How is job costing
used to track production costs?, we provide the detailed information needed to prepare the schedules and profit and loss account presented in Figure 1.7 Income Statement Schedules for Custom Furniture Company and Figure 1.8 Income Statement for Custom Furniture Company. At this point, your job is to understand how we use the stock cost flow equation to calculate raw
materials placed in production, the cost of manufactured goods, and the cost of goods sold. (Note: Companies that use a perpetual inventory system do not necessarily prepare these formal schedules, as permanent systems update records immediately when inventory is transferred from one inventory account to another. However, these companies periodically take a physical
count to ensure the accuracy of inventory accounts and use the cost flow equation and similar schematics to ensure that their perpetual system balances are accurate. Note 1.62 Business in Action 1.8 shows how the cost flow equation can be used to analyze the effects of fraud allegedly committed at Rite Aid.) Figure 1.7 Profit and loss account schedules for Custom Furniture
Company a From the Company's balance sheet on April 30 (April 30 final balance sheet is the same as May 1 initial balance sheet). b Of the company's balance sheet on 31 May. c This is actual production overhead for the period and includes indirect materials, indirect labor, factory utilities, and other factory related costs for the month. In Chapter 2 How Is Job Costing Used to
Track Production Costs?, we look at an alternative approach to recording production overhead called normal costing. Use the cost flow equation to analyze fraud Corporation has 3,400 drugstores in the United States. In 2002, the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC) filed accounting fraud charges against several former Rite Aid executives. The SEC complaint alleged that
Rite Aid had significantly overstated income for several years. According to the complaint, Rite Aid executives committed financial fraud in various fields, one of which involved inventory. At the end of the company's fiscal year, the physical inventory count showed $9 million less than Rite Aid's inventory balance on the books, presumably due to physical deterioration of the goods
or theft. Rite Aid executives reportedly failed to record this contraction, thereby ending inventory on the balance sheet and understating costs of goods sold on the profit and loss account. Using the cost flow equation you see how not including the loss of $9 million would underestimate the cost of goods sold. By not capturing the inventory loss, Rite Aid overestimated the stock (an
asset) on the balance sheet by $9,000,000 and the overcharging of goods sold (a charge) by $9,000,000 in the profit and loss account. This eventually increased the profit by $9,000,000 because the reported costs were too low. This inventory fraud was a relatively small part of the fraud allegedly committed by rite aid executives. In fact, Rite Aid's net income was revised
downwards in 2002 by $1,600,000,000. Several former executives pleaded guilty to conspiracy charges. The former chief executive, Martin Grass, was sentenced to eight years in prison and the former chief financial officer, Franklyn Bergonzi, was sentenced to 28 months in prison. Rite Aid shares fell from a high of $50 per share to $5 per share in 2003. Question: Manufacturing
companies clearly have more complex accounting systems to take into account all the costs associated with product production. However, the profit and loss account for a production company is not much different from the profit and loss account for a merchandising company. What are the main differences between the profit and loss account of production and merchandising
companies? Answer: The main differences are as follows: Merchandising companies do not calculate the raw materials placed in the production or cost of goods manufactured (shown in the upper section of Figure 1.7 Profit Statement Schedules for Custom Furniture Company). Merchandisers buy goods from suppliers instead of manufacturing goods. The cost of these purchases
from suppliers is often mentioned in the profit and loss account, as opposed to the cost of goods the profit and loss account of a manufacturer. The net purchase line consists of purchases, purchases returns and allowances, purchase discounts, and freight in. Merchandisers do not use the scheme of the cost of manufactured goods (and related schedule of raw materials placed in
production). Merchandisers use an account called inventory, or just inventory, instead of finished goods inventory. This reflects that merchandisers do not produce goods. Table 1.5 Income Statement Terminology in Manufacturing and Merchandising Companies summarizes the differences in profit and loss account terminology between manufacturing and merchandising
companies. Table 1.5 Profit and loss account Terminology in production and merchandising companies The following terms are used by production and merchandising companies: sales, cost of goods for sale, cost of goods sold, operating expenses, sales, general and administrative and operating profit. The inventory of finished goods is used by production companies.
Merchandise inventory is used by merchandising companies. Cost of manufactured goods is used by production companies. Net purchases are used by merchandising companies. Figure 1.9 Merchandising Company Income Statement for Fashion, Inc. presents a profit and loss account for Fashion, Inc., a apparel retail company. Note that the scheme of the cost of manufactured
goods (and related schedule of raw materials placed in production) is not necessary for merchandising companies, and the conditions merchandise inventory and net purchases are used instead of finished goods inventory and the cost of manufactured goods. Also, the schedule of the cost of goods sold is simply included in the profit and loss account. Many companies prefer this
approach because it means they don't have to draw up a separate schedule. Figure 1.9 Merchandising Company Income Statement for Fashion, Inc. Key Takeaways Three schedules are necessary to prepare an income statement for a manufacturing company, in the following order: Schedule of raw materials placed in production, which shows cost of direct materials added to
work-in process inventory and cost of indirectly added materials added to manufacturing overhead Schedule of cost of goods manufactured , which shows cost of goods completed and transferred out of work-in-process inventory into finished goods inventory sold goods, showing that the cost of goods sold and transferred from the inventory of finished goods in the cost of goods
sold The profit statements of merchandising companies differ from those of the processing companies in different areas. Merchandising companies do not use a schedule of raw materials placed in production or a schedule of the cost of manufactured goods, and they use a merchandise inventory account instead of a finished goods inventory account. In addition, they use the term
net purchases instead of the cost of manufactured goods and often include the scheme of the goods sold in the profit and loss account instead of presenting them separately. Fine Cabinets, Inc., produces custom cabinets. The following inventory balances appeared on the balance sheet. (Please note that the most up-to-date financial information is presented in the first column.)
Fine Fine had $1,265,000 in sales for the year ended December 31, 2012. The company also had the following costs for the year: Of the total raw materials placed in production for the year, $12,000 was for indirect materials and should be deducted to find direct materials placed in production. Required: Solution for assessing problem 1.8 questions Describe the characteristics of
management accounting and financial accounting. What are non-financial performance buddies? Give some examples. Which auditor (financial or executive) would prepare each of the following reports: Earnings and loss account for the Chevrolet division of General Motors Balance Sheet for PepsiCo prepared in accordance with U.S. GAAP The Boston Symphony Orchestra
budgeted earnings and loss account for the next quarter Defect rate of computer chips produced by Intel Statement of cash flows for Hewlett-Packard prepared in accordance with U.S. GAAP Describe the schedule and control functions provided by most managers. What is the primary responsibility of the controller? How do the treasurer's responsibilities differ from those of the
auditor? Explain why ethical behavior is so important to financial and accounting staff. Briefly summarize the Institute of Management Accountants (IMA) Statement of Ethical Professional Practice presented in Figure 1.2 IMA Statement of Ethical Professional Practice. What is the purpose of this statement? Review Note 1.27 Business in Action 1.3 Why should the company's
former employees improperly include information as described here? Review Note 1.28 Business in Action 1.4 Why is improving ethics a top priority for companies such as Home Depot and Hewlett-Packard? What is an enterprise resource planning system? Why do manufacturing companies use product costing systems to track costs throughout the production process? Describe
production costs and non-production costs. Give examples of each. Describe the difference between direct materials and direct labor versus indirect materials and indirect labor. Why are product costs and period costs used to describe production costs and non-production costs? How does the timing of registration costs differ between product and period costs? Review Note 1.43
Business in Action 1.5 Why are items such as fuselage, engine, transmission, carpet and chairs classified as direct materials and items such as glue, paint and screws classified as indirect materials? Review Note 1.48 Business in Action 1.6 Give two examples of selling costs and two examples of general and administrative expenses at PepsiCo. Describe the three inventory
accounts used to fix product costs What are the three categories of product costs that flow through the work-in-process inventory account? Describe them all. When are the cost of goods sold (often called selling costs) used and how is the amount in the dollar dollar account determined? Review Note 1.57 Business in Action 1.7 What are the names and amounts in dollars from
the inventory accounts on the balance sheet? What is the total amount of product costs recorded as an expense on the profit and loss account for the year ended December 31, 2010? Describe the comparison with inventory cost flow and how it applies to the three schemes shown in Figure 1.7 Profit and Loss Account Schedules for a Custom Furniture Business. How does a profit
and loss account of a merchandising company differ from a profit and loss account of a production company? Short exercises Accounting information at Sportswear Company. See the dialogue between the president and accountant at Sportswear Company presented at the beginning of the chapter. Why can't the president find information for each product line (hats and sweaters)
in the financial statements? Who within the company typically provides this kind of information? Financial Versus Managerial Accounting. Maria is the loan officer at a local bank that lends money to Old Town Market, a small supermarket. She is requesting multiple quarterly reports on a permanent basis to assess whether the store is able to repay the loan. Give an example of a
financial accounting report and two examples of management accounting reports that Maria might request. Planning and control. Two graduates recently started a web page design agency. The first month was just completed, and the owners are in the process of comparing budgeted revenue and expenses with actual revenue and expenses for the month. Would this be
considered part of the planning or control function? Explain. Financial and Accounting staff. Determine whether the chief financial officer, controller, treasurer, internal auditor, chief accountant, financial accountant or tax accountant would perform the following tasks. (Tip: Some job titles can be used multiple times and others may not be used at all.) Compiles annual reports for
shareholders and creditors Provides a quarterly summary of financial results to the CEO and board of directors Provides earnings and loss reports by product line Calculates Estimated Quarterly Tax Payments Oversees the Treasurer and Internal Auditor's Sources of Funding and Manages Short-Term Investments Verifies That Annual Financial Information Is Accurate Enterprise
Resource Planning (ERP) System. Enterprise Resource Planning (ERP) systems are designed to record and share information in real time and real-time in functional and geographic areas. However, these systems tend to be expensive to buy and maintain. Why, despite the cost millions of dollars investing in ERP systems? Production cost conditions. Indicate whether any of the
following production costs would be classified as direct materials, direct labor, or production overhead. Overhead. Supervisor responsible for several product lines Hourly workers who assemble goods Grease used to maintain maintenance bike frame machines used to build a road bike Factory Property Tax Glue used to assemble Toy Manufacturing Cost Terms. Indicate whether
any of the following production costs would be classified as direct materials, direct labor, or production overhead. Depreciation on production equipment Paint used to produce wagons Accounting staff performing tax services for a customer Nails used to assemble Cabinets Fiber used to assemble a custom boat Timepiece workers assemble goods Factory utilities Production and
Nonmanufacturing Cost Conditions. Burns Company has incurred costs for the following items. Salary of Chief Financial Officer Factory Insurance Salary for Vendors Raw materials used in production easily traced back to the product The depreciation of computer equipment for the Accounting Department Insurance for the building department's Production Line employees
Requires Administrative support for production supervisors: Specify whether each item should be categorized as a product or period cost. Specify whether each item should be categorized as direct materials, direct labor, production overhead, sales or general and administrative. Production and non-production cost conditions. Leighton, Inc., incurred costs for the following items.
Concierge services in the Manufacturing Facility Personnel Department provides Shipping costs for raw materials purchased from a supplier, easily traced to the product Newspaper Ads Supervisor of different production lines Insurance for factory equipment Production line workers Administrative support for sales personnel Required: Indicate whether each item should be
categorized as a product or period cost. Specify whether each item should be categorized as direct materials, direct labor, production overhead, sales or general and administrative. Accounts used to record product costs. Combine each of the following accounts with the correct description that follows. _____ Raw material inventory _____ Work-in-process inventory _____ Stock of
finished products _____ Cost of goods sold Used to record product costs associated with goods sold Used to record the costs of materials not yet put into production Used to record product costs related to goods that have been used in full use : Manufacturing Versus Merchandising. Match each of the following terms used in the profit and loss account of a production company
with the equivalent term used profit and loss account of a merchandising company. Manufacturing Company _____ Cost of Manufactured Goods ___ Work-in-process inventory ___ Stock Finished Products _____ Cost of Goods Sold Merchandising Company Merchandise Merchandise The same term is used by a merchandising company Net purchases Do not apply to a
merchandising company. Exercises: Set a financial versus management accounting (production). The profit and loss account from Ford's annual report is presented in a concise form as follows. (This information was obtained from the Company's website, .) Required: The financial information contained in the Company's annual report was primarily prepared for shareholders and
creditors in accordance with U.S. Generally Accepted Accounting Principles (U.S. GAAP). Does the profit and loss account provide sufficient detailed information for managers at Ford? Explain. Provide at least three additional detailed pieces of financial information that would help managers evaluate performance at Ford. Provide at least two non-financial measures that would
help managers evaluate ford's performance. Organisational structure. The following list of staff within organizations comes from figure 1.2 IMA Statement of Ethical Professional Practice. Board of Directors Chief financial officer Controller Managerial accountant Financial accountant Tax accountant Treasurer Internal Accountant Required: Match each previous item with the most
accurate description as follows. Helps prepare information used for decision-making within the organization Helps to prepare tax reports for government agencies, including the Internal Revenue Service, which is responsible for confirming that the company's controls are effective in ensuring accurate financial data, and serves as an independent link with the board of directors
responsible for all financial and accounting functions within the organization and usually reports to the chief executive officer Elected by the Shareholders of the Company Oversees the Executive Accountant, Financial Accountant, and Tax Accountant responsible for obtaining funding for the organization, projecting cash flow needs, and managing cash and short-term investments
helps to draw up financial information , usually in accordance with U.S. GAAP, for those outside the company's Schedule of commodities placed in production. The balance in Sedona Company's commodities stock account was $110,000 and $135,000 at the end of September. Commodities purchased during the month totaled $50,000. Sedona used $8,000 in indirect materials for
the month. Required: Prepare a schedule of raw materials placed in production for the month of September. Schedule of the cost of the manufactured goods. The balance on Reid Company's work-in-process inventory account was $300,000 and $320,000 at the end of March Production costs for the month follow. Required: Make a schedule of the cost of goods manufactured for
the month of March. Schedule of the cost of goods sold. The balance in Blue Oak Company's stock account finished products was early September and $28,000 at the end of September. Cost of goods manufactured for the month amounted to $17,000. Required: Make a schedule of the cost of the goods sold for the month of September. Income statement. Auto Products, Inc.,
had the next activity for the month of October. Required: Create a profit and loss account for the month of October. Exercises: Set B Financial Versus Managerial Accounting (Merchandising). Home Depot's annual report is presented in a concise form as follows. (This information was obtained from the Company's website, .) Required: The financial information contained in the
Company's annual report was primarily prepared for shareholders and creditors in accordance with U.S. GAAP. Does the profit and loss account provide sufficient detailed information for managers at Home Depot? Explain. Provide at least three additional detailed pieces of financial information that would help managers evaluate performance at Home Depot. Provide at least two
non-financial measures that would help managers evaluate performance at Home Depot. Organisational structure. The following list of staff within organizations comes from figure 1.2 IMA Statement of Ethical Professional Practice. Board of Directors Chief financial officer Controller Managerial accountant Financial accountant Tax accountant Treasurer Internal Auditor Required:
Match each previous item with the most accurate description as follows: Responsible for hiring and overseeing the chief executive officer Assists in compiling financial information for people outside the company, such as shareholders and bondholders responsible for assessing internal controls within the company and ensuring accurate financial data Responsible for controller,
treasurer and internal auditor functions within the organization Responsible for projecting cash flow needs and managing cash and short-term investments oversees the executive accountant, financial accountant, and tax auditor Prepares earnings information per product, which is used for decision making within the organization Helps establish tax strategies for the organization of
raw materials placed in production. The balance in Clay Company's commodities inventory account was $45,000 at the beginning of April and $38,000 at the end of April. Commodities purchased during the month totaled $55,000. Clay used $14,000 in indirect materials for the month. Required: Prepare a schedule of raw materials placed in production for the month of April.
Schedule of the cost of the manufactured goods. The balance on Verdi Production, Inc.'s work-in-process inventory account was $100,000 in early May. and $750,000 at the end of May. Production costs for the month follow. Required: Make a schedule of the cost of goods manufactured for the month of May. Schedule of the cost of goods sold. The balance sheet in Posada
finished goods inventory account was $650,000 at the beginning of March and $625,000 at the end of March. Cost of goods manufactured for the month amounted to $445,000. Required: Make a schedule of the cost of the goods sold for the month of March. Income statement. Game Products, Inc., had the next activity for the month of June. Required: Create a profit and loss
account for the month of June. Problems Financial Versus Management Accounting (Service). The profit and loss account from the United Parcel Service (UPS) annual report is presented in a concise form as follows. (This information was obtained from the Company's website, .) Required: The financial information contained in the Company's annual report was primarily prepared
for shareholders and creditors in accordance with U.S. GAAP. Does the profit and loss account provide enough detailed information for managers at UPS? Explain. Provide at least three additional detailed pieces of financial information that would help managers evaluate performance at UPS. Provide at least two non-financial measures that would help managers evaluate
performance at UPS. Profit and loss account and support schedules. The following financial information is for Industrial Company. (Please note that the most up-to-date financial information is presented in the first column.) Of the total raw materials in production for the year, $36,000 was for indirect materials. Industrial had $3,795,000 in sales for the year ended December 31,
2011. The company also had the following costs for the year: Required: Prepare a schedule of raw materials placed in production for the year ended December 31, 2011. Create a schedule of the cost of goods manufactured for the year ended December 31, 2011. Make a schedule of the cost of the goods sold for the year ended December 31, 2011. Create a profit and loss
account for the year ended December 31, 2011. Describe the three types of costs included in the cost of goods sold in the profit and loss account. (Dollar amounts are not required in your descriptions.) Profit and loss account and support schedules. The following financial information is for Danville Company. (Please note that the most up-to-date financial information is presented
in the first column.) Of the total raw materials in production for the year, $12,000 was for indirect materials. Danville had $1,265,000 in sales for the year ended December 31, 2011. The company also had the following costs for the year: Required: Prepare a schedule of raw materials placed in production for the year ended December 31, 2011. Make a schedule of the cost of
goods manufactured year ended December 31, 2011. Make a schedule of the cost of the goods sold for the year ended December 31, 2011. Create a profit and loss account for the year ended December 31, 2011. Describe the three types of costs included in the cost of the manufactured goods. (Dollar amounts are not required in your descriptions.) descriptions.) Statement and
supporting schedules. The following information is for Ciena, Inc., for the year ended December 31, 2011. Of the total raw materials in production for the year, $18,000 was for indirect materials. Required: Prepare a schedule of raw materials placed in production for the year ended December 31, 2011. Create a schedule of the cost of goods manufactured for the year ended
December 31, 2011. Make a schedule of the cost of the goods sold for the year ended December 31, 2011. Create a profit and loss account for the year ended December 31, 2011. Profit and loss account and support schedules. The following information is for Diablo, Inc., for the year ended December 31, 2011. Of the total raw materials in production for the year, $72,000 was for
indirect materials. Required: Prepare a schedule of raw materials placed in production for the year ended December 31, 2011. Create a schedule of the cost of goods manufactured for the year ended December 31, 2011. Make a schedule of the cost of the goods sold for the year ended December 31, 2011. Create a profit and loss account for the year ended December 31, 2011.
A step further: Skill-Building Cases Ethics: Accounting for Obsolete Inventory. High Tech, Inc. is a government-owned company that manufactures laser and ink beam printers. Jorge is an accounting officer who works for the company's controller and is involved in the preparation of the annual report. One of High Tech's competitors developed a superior color laser beam printer
using a cheaper manufacturing process. Jorge realizes that High Tech's significant inventory of color laser jet printers is effectively outdated and will need to be written down to its net recoverable value in accordance with U.S. GAAP. This means higher costs and lower profits. Jorge's boss, the controller, is aware of the situation, but the chief financial officer is not. In fact, the
controller told the CFO that High Tech has no outdated inventory. Both Jorge's boss and the CFO receive bonuses linked to the company's profits. The external auditors are carrying out the audit and are not aware of the outdated inventory. Required: How should Jorge handle this situation? Use the IMA's Statement of Ethical Professional Practice in Figure 1.2 IMA Statement of
Ethical Professional Practice to guide you answer this question. Internet Project: Institute of Management Accountants. Visit the Institute of Management Accountants website ( ). View different parts of the site (e.g. About IMA or Certification) and write a one-page summary of your findings. Internet Project: American Institute of Public Accountants. Visit the American Institute of
Certified Public Accountants (AICPA; ) website. View different parts of the site (e.g. About the AICPA or Professional Resources) and write an overview of a single page of your Internet Project: Sarbanes-Oxley Act 2002. Visit the Securities and Exchange Commission ( ) website and click on laws and regulations. Click on the full text of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002. Required:
Go to Section 302, Corporate Social Responsibility for Financial Reports and summarize the six requirements in this section. Let's say you're the chief financial officer of a government company. What concerns could you have about these requirements? Go to section 404, subsection a, Management Assessment of Internal Controls. Let's say you're an executive officer of a
government company. What two points should you present in the annual report? Ethics: Companies accused of committing fraud. Using a source like The Wall Street Journal, BusinessWeek, or an Internet search engine, find an article about an organization accused of committing accounting fraud. Write a one-page summary of your findings. Add a copy of the article to your
summary. Internet Project: Finding company with ethics policy. Using the Internet, find a company that has standards for ethical behavior. (Some companies refer to these standards as a code of ethics; others may use different terminology.) Write a one-page summary of your findings. Group activity: Stock accounts for production company. In groups of two to four students, use
the Internet to find a production company that presents three inventory accounts on the balance sheet or in the notes on the financial statements. Add a printout of your findings and explain what each account and its amount represents in dollars. Comprehensive case ethics: accounting for income and expenses. Equipment Group produces digging equipment for contractors.
Equipment Group is working on the financial statements of its shareholders, who expect a profit of $200 million for the year ended December 31. The controller (Jeff) and CFO (Kathy) receive bonuses totaling 50 percent of their salary if corporate profits exceed $200 million. Sarah is a staff accountant who works for the controller. A week before the end of the financial year, a
customer decides to postpone a significant purchase of equipment until March of the following year. As a result, Equipment Group's earnings will fall by $2 million to $198 million for the year. Jeff, the controller, approaches Sarah and asks her to figure out a way to increase profits by $2,500,000. He suggests looking at sales that are in early January and maybe moving them until
December. He also indicates that some December charges may be pushed back and included in January. Required: Is there a problem with the controller's request? Explain From. How should Sarah handle this situation? There are many possible steps, as described in the IMA's Statement of Ethical Professional Practice shown in Figure 1.2 IMA Statement of Ethical Professional
What are the possible consequences for Sarah if she agrees to do what Jeff suggests? Suggests?
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	Identify the area of accounting that is most involved in each of the following responsibilities.

