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Posted 2019 Description program SkillFlix™ for Parents (SkillFlix) is a skill-building online video library designed for parents of moderately cognitive-impaired youth. By modeling effective conversations, SkillFlix videos teach parents conversational skills and sexual health information that allows them to have more productive conversations
with their children. SkillFlix for Parents is undergoing formative evaluation in order to improve program design and implementation and add evidence-base to teen pregnancy prevention. A formative evaluation will be followed by an evaluation of the effectiveness of the programme. Program Snapshot Population: Parents of Cognitively
Disabled Students (Ages 10-26) Location(s): Kent, Ionia, and Montcalm Counties, MI Partners: Nine School Districts in Kent, Ionia, and Montcalm Counties goals Increase parents' knowledge of adolescent sexual health Teach parents conversational skills and increase their ability to have effective conversations about sexual health with
their cognitively-impaired teens Increase the frequency of communication about sexual health between parents and their cognitive-impaired teen strategies Skill-building videos for SkilllixF parents for parents is a skill-building online video library that teaches parents how to have conversations about sexual health with their cognitive
impairments by adolescents. SkillFlix videos feature actors portraying cognitively disabled youth and their parents having conversations about sexual health. Every sixty-second video models a micro-skill™, a small action that parents can take to improve the quality of their conversations. Videos are organized by skillset; Each skill contains
three to five videos that teach separate micro-skills. For example, skill using conversational tone involves videos about microquality using relaxed and open body language and staying positive or neutral when surprised.. The videos also contain information on topics of sexual health, including abstinence, pregnancy and sexually
transmitted infections (STIs). By watching videos and exercising, parents learn skills that allow them to effectively talk to their children and respond to unpredictable situations. SkillFlix for Parents is an extension of skillflix training technology, originally developed for dfusion health educators with national health funding institutes. Parallel
school lessons for young people All participants in skillflix intervention for parents have children who receive the Making a Difference curriculum at school. Funded by the HHS Administration on Children and Families' Family and Youth Services Bureau and implemented by the Kent School District, this evidence-based program has been
tailored to moderately cognitive students and provides them with knowledge and skills to reduce their risk pregnancy. SkillFlix for parents videos align with making a difference curriculum and allow parents to have conversations with their children about what they learn at school as they learn. Teachers at these schools have been trained
by the facility and provide students and their families with an extra layer of support. Statistiky na první pohled 24.2 Montcalm County teen porodnost (na 1,000 ženy ve věku 15-19) v 20171 21.1 Ionia County teen porodnost (na 1,000 ženy ve věku 15-19) v 20171 18.4 Kent County dospívající porodnost (na 1,000 ženy ve věku 15-19) v
20171 18.4 Kent County dospívající porodnost (na 1,000 ženy ve věku 15-19) v 20171 18.4 Kent County dospívající porodnost (na 1,0000 žen ve věku 15-19) v 20171 18.8 Národní porodnost dospívajících (na 1,000 ženy ve věku 15-19) v 20172 42 SkillFlix pro rodiče videa k dispozici Sdílení znalostí ke zlepšení výsledků Během cílové
skupiny, rodiče navrhli, aby se spojili jako skupina, aby sledovali videa SkillFlix a diskutovali o tom, jak mluvit se svými kognitivními dětmi o sexuálním zdraví. The parents asked the special coordinator of the school to set up discussion groups, which are planned for the coming year. Grantee Information Cheryl Blair Health Education
Consultant 616-365-2269CherylBlair@kentisd.org Print all the success here - PDF. (The content is undergoing a 508 review and will be updated until remediated. For immediate help, contact: opa@hhs.gov.) About the TPP Program The Office of Population Affairs Teen Pregnancy Prevention (TPP) Program is a federal grant program that
funds various organizations working to prevent teen pregnancy across the United States. OAH invests both in the implementation of evidence-based programs, as well as in the development and evaluation of new and innovative approaches to preventing teenage pregnancy. The OAH TPP Program reaches adolescents ages 10-19,
focusing on populations most in need in order to reduce differences in teen pregnancy and birth rates. Footnote 1 michigan department of health and social services. (2018). Pregnancy by outcomes and fertility, abortion and pregnancy By county, Estimated population of women, Residents of Michigan, 2017, Women aged 15 - 19.
Adapted from 2 Martin, J.A., Hamilton, B.E., Osterman, M.J., Driscoll, A.K., &amp; Drake, M.S. (2018). Births: Final figures for 2017. National Report on Vital Function Statistics, 67(8). Hyattsville, MD: National Center for Health Statistics. Obtained from - PDF Photo: shutterstock.comYou need children to understand that good public
schools promote the value of homes in their district. And while higher quality schools are usually accompanied by higher property taxes, homeowners in these counties are eventually repaid through higher home sale prices. Getting paid sounds great, but how many are we talking about? research research Realtor.com shows that to enter
a desirable school district, 9% of buyers say they would pay 11% to 20% over budget. Separately, 17% report that they would pay to be close enough for their children to go to and from school. Related: 7 Renovation Tips to Increase Sales ValueIn the reckoning between adult equipment and education for children, you've agreed: kids win.
Realtor.com found that 62% of buyers would miss a home spa if it meant getting to the right school district. 50% would admit easy access to shopping, while 44% would give up space in the form of a bonus room. If the house you plan to sell is located in a highly sought after school district, do everything in your power to emphasize that
fact in all your real estate marketing materials. Many potential buyers are parents of children currently in the school system, so make sure to get a word between neighbors and local friends. If you're buying a house, use a search tool that lets you filter by school district, because county boundaries aren't always in line with urban, village,
and city lines. After all, you can not assume that your children will be assigned to participate in the same school as the children on the block, or even next door. Individuals can use ForRent.com, Zillow or Hotpads websites to search for apartments in a particular school district and see boundaries for the district. Users can see the
attendance zone for a particular school to see if their children would be eligible to attend a particular school while living at an apartment address, Hotpads notes. Users can visit the Hotpads website and select all filters for the number of bedrooms and price range for the apartment. They can then enter location information in the search
box, and then start the search to see a map of the bytes in the area. Clicking on the result invokes the listing shows that it contains a list of elementary, middle and secondary schools that residents can attend, shows Hotpads.Zillow's website allows users to select filters for the desired type of apartment and then enter the name of the
school district in the search box. This opens a map with the border, with apartments within the border is part of the school district. Clicking on the result of the property on the map will display a detailed listing with information about the school. ForRent.com allows users to enter a specific name for a school district or school in the search
box, and then view nearby apartments. After setting filters for price, bedrooms, amenities, bathrooms, pet policies or features, users can enter a search term to see apartments that meet the conditions. Jonathan Kirn/Stone/Getty Images The best way to find out one's school district is to consult an online search engine that uses
geographic identifiers to determine the school district. One such tool is provided by the U.S. Department of Education's National Center for Educational Statistics and Schools provide a similar one. Once one determines the correct school district, it is sometimes still necessary to find out to which school it is assigned. This can be done by
calling the local school district. Many larger school districts, including Los Angeles and New York counties, provide online search tools that use the applicant's home address to determine the assigned school. School.
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