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Packet tracer simulation mode ping

2018-04-09 12:09 Source: Other authors: Responsible Name Editor: Konbeier Do you know how to enable analog inisco packet tracer mode? If you don't know, take a look at the diagram tutorial that turns on analog mode in cisco packet tracer and hopefully you can get help. Cisco packet tracer analog mode on method: 1, open Cisco
Packet Tracer, note that there are two buttons in the lower right corner of the software interface, namely realtime mode (real-time mode) and simulation mode (analog mode) switch button. As for the real-time mode, I don't have to present it. Everyone understands. 2, click the button, switch to analog mode, and then an action box appears
on the right side of the interface. 3. Let's experiment to understand a specific function: open the cmd pc1 command window, type ping 192.168.0.254, ping the router on the network segment. At this point, the ping packet stops moving. We need to click auto-option /Paly in the action window. 4. Now you will see an envelope-like package
on the topology map, which is uploaded as an animation. In the figure, the eyes in 1 represent the packages moving in the drawing, 2 represent the time needed, 3 represent the last device through which the package passed, 4 represents the device in which the package is located, 5 represents the package type, and 6 represents the
color of the package in the drawing. 5, the slider circled in red in the figure, you can adjust the baud rate of the packages. Set your speed quickly and you don't have to wait in a hurry. 6, double-click the package in the animation, a dialog box appears. We can clearly see the detailed format of the package, including the source address,
destination address, and other details. 7, click edit filters (Edit filter) if you just want to see the icmp package in the animation, then just select icmp. You won't see other packages that confuse the line of sight. Are these diagram tutorials for enabling analog mode in cisco packet tracer, has anyone learned? Last updated August 2, 2020 by
Admin Answers Note: Red font color or gray highlighting indicate text that appears only in a copy of Replies. Adresowanie tabeli Adres IP interfejsu urządzenia / Prefiks Brama domyślna R1 G0/0 2001:db8:1:1:1/64 Nie/A R1 G0/1 10.10.1.97 255.255.255.224 N/A R 1 S0/0/1 10.10.1.6 255.255.255.252 N/A R1 S0/0/1 2001:db8:1:2::2/64
N/A R1 S0/0/1 fe80::1 N/A R2 S0/0/0 10.10.1.5 255.255.252 N/A R2 S0/0/0 2001:db8:1:2::1/64 N/A R2 S0/0/1 10.10.1.9 255.255.252 N/A R2 S0/0/1 2001:db8:1:3::1/64 Nie/A R2 S0/0/1 fe80::2 N/A R3 G0/0 2001:db8:1:4:1/64 N/A R3 G0/1 10.10.1.17 255.255.240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240
N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/240 N/A R3 S0/0/1 10.10.1.10 255.255.252 N/A R3 S0/0/1 N/A R3 S0/0/1 fe80::3 N/A PC1 NIC 10.10.1.98 255.255.255.2 24 10.10.1.97 NIC PC2 2001:db8:1:1:2/64 fe80::1 PC3 NIC 10.. 10.1.18
255.255.255.240 10.10.17 PC4 NIC 2001:db8:1:4::2/64 fe80::1 Part 1: Test and Restore IPv4 Connectivity Part 2: Test and Restore IPv6 Connectivity Scenario There are connectivity issues in this activity. In addition to collecting and documenting o Network, locate problems, and implement acceptable solutions to restore connectivity.
Note: The user's EXEC password is cisco. A privileged EXEC password is a class. Instructions Click PC1 and open the command prompt. Enter ipconfig /all to collect IPv4 information. Complete the addressing table with an IPv4 address, subnet mask, and default gateway. Click PC3 and open the command prompt. Enter ipconfig /all to
collect IPv4 information. Complete the addressing table with an IPv4 address, subnet mask, and default gateway. Use the ping command to test connectivity between PC1 and PC3. Ping should fail. From pc1, enter the command necessary to track the route to PC3. What is the last successful IPv4 address that has been reached?
10.10.1.97 The track will finally end after 30 attempts. Enter Ctrl+C to stop tracking before 30 attempts. In pc3, enter the command necessary to track the route to PC1. Question: What is the last successful IPv4 address that has been reached? 10.10.1.17 Enter Ctrl+C to stop tracking. Open the configuration window Click R1. Press
ENTER and log on to the router. Enter show ip interface to see a list of interfaces and their status. The router has two IPv4 addresses. One should be saved in step 2a. Question: What is the other? 10.10.1.6 Enter show ip route to see a list of networks to which the router is connected. Note that two networks are connected to serial0/0/1.
Question: What are they? 10.10.1.6/32, 10.10.1.4/30 Repeat steps 2e to 2g with R3 and save your answers. 10.10.1.10, 10.10.1.8/30, 10.10.1.10/32 Click R2. Press ENTER and log on to the router. Enter the show ip short interface command and register your addresses. Enter your addresses here. 10.10.1.2, 10.10.1.9 Run more tests if
this helps visualize the problem. Simulation mode is available. Close the Configuration Window Step 3: Suggest a solution to the problem. Compare your answers in step 2 with the documentation available for the network. Question: What is an error? Serial interface R2 0/0/0 is configured with the wrong IP address. What solution do you
propose to solve the problem? Configure the correct IP address in serial interface R2 0/0/0 (10.10.1.5) Step 4: Implement the plan. Implement the solution proposed in step 3b. Step 5: Verify that connectivity has been restored. From PC1 to PC3 test connectivity. From PC3 to PC1 test connectivity. Question: Has the problem been
resolved? Yes Step 6: Document the solution. Part 2: Test and restore IPv6 connectivity Step 1: Use ipv6config and ping to verify connectivity. Click PC2 and open the command prompt. Enter ipv6config /all to collect IPv6 information. Complete the addressing table with IPv6, subnet prefix, and default gateway. Click PC4 and open open
Command line. Enter ipv6config /all to collect IPv6 information. Complete the addressing table with an IPv6 address, subnet prefix, and default gateway. Test connectivity between PC2 and PC4. Ping should fail. Step 2: Locate the source of the connectivity failure. In pc2, enter the command necessary to track the route to PC4. Question:
What is the last successful IPv6 address that has been reached? 2001:db8:1:3::2 The track will finally end after 30 attempts. Enter Ctrl+C to stop tracking before 30 attempts. In pc4, enter the command necessary to track the route to PC2. Question: What is the last successful IPv6 address that has been reached? IPv6 address not
reached. Enter Ctrl+C to stop tracking. Click R3. Press ENTER and log on to the router. Enter the show ipv6 short interface command to see a list of interfaces and their status. The router has two IPv6 addresses. Please match the gateway address saved in step 1d. Question: Is there a discrepancy? So run more tests if it helps visualize
the problem. Simulation mode is available. Close the Step 3 command prompt: Suggest a solution to resolve the issue. Compare your answers in step 2 with the documentation available for the network. Question: What is an error? PC4 uses the wrong default gateway configuration. What solution do you propose to solve the problem?
Configure PC4 with the correct default gateway address: FE80::3. Step 4: Implement the plan. Implement the solution proposed in step 3b. Step 5: Verify that connectivity has been restored. From PC2 to PC4 test connectivity. From PC4 to PC2 test connectivity. Question: Has the problem been resolved? Yes Step 6: Document the
solution. Cisco Packet Tracer is a Cisco-based assisted learning tool that provides a network simulation environment for beginners to design, configure, and troubleshoot Cisco web courses. To make better use of this tool, you also need to understand the powerful simulation patterns in the software. The Cisco Packet Tracer opens the
Cisco Packet Tracer and notes that there are two buttons in the lower right corner of the software interface: realtime mode and simulation mode. As for the real-time mode, I don't have to present it. Everyone understands. Simulation mode can express the packet transmission process using live Flash animation and clearly see the route of
packet transmission and visually display network packets. Click the button to switch to analog mode, and an action box appears on the right side of the interface. Let's experiment with a specific function: open the cmd pc1 command window and type ping 192.168.0.254, the router where the ping is located. At this point, the ping packet
stops moving. We need to click Auto Capture/Paly in the action window Filters (Edit Filter) if you just want to see the icmp package in the animation, then just select icmp. You won't see other packages that confuse the line of sight. By observing the intuitive simulation animation, I think you can better understand the direction of packet
routing on the network. Lay a solid foundation for a bad idea. If you think this experience is good, you can click on the thumbs below to give support, or click on the five-pointed star below to collect. I feel you can help your friends, you can also click on the right corner of the double arrow to share, if you also like computer network skills, you
can click to follow Oh! The experience is for information purposes only, and if you want to address specific issues (especially in the legal, medical and other fields), it is recommended to consult the relevant specialists in detail. The author declares: This experience is original according to the real experience, without permission, refused to
duplicate. Page 2 Let's experiment with specific functions: open the cmd pc1 command window and type ping 192.168.0.254, the router where the ping is located. At this point, the ping packet stops moving. We need to click auto-option /Paly in the action window. (Automatic capture).
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