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How to factory reset asus laptop from bios

One of the most useful features of modern devices, including the iPhone, is the ability to reset them in the factory. This deletes all custom information, settings, photos, and apps for your device and sets the default factory status. You usually do this when you're about to sell or recycle your phone, or if you're trying to fix a serious problem. The whole process takes several minutes,
although in certain circumstances it may take longer. Before you reset your iPhone to factory settings, you should know what the risk of doing it. Many iPhones have default settings that require a unique unlock code after resetting, which locks many people from their phones. But there are ways to do this. Also, if you don't have a backup, you might lose all photos, videos, apps, and
documents you can store on your phone. Martin Prescott/Getty Images If your device doesn't work, you'll need to use iTunes on your Mac or PC to reset your iPhone. Make sure you have the latest version of iTunes or you may not be able to reset your phone. You can update iTunes on your Mac computer by opening it and clicking the Apple menu. From there, select System
Preferences, and then click Software Update. To do this on your computer, select Help from the menu bar at the top of the iTunes window. The menu will select Check for updates. StockRocket/Getty Images To ensure that you don't lose any personal data on your phone, you should back up before resetting your factory settings. To do this with iCloud, make sure you've connected
your device to a Wi-Fi network. Go to Settings and click your name. Select iCloud from this menu, and then select iCloud Backup. Then just tap the Backup button now. To use an iTunes backup, connect your phone to your computer with a USB cable. When iTunes finds your device, go to the device icon in the upper-left corner. This icon opens the device menu and you can
select your phone. On the left-hand menu page, search for the Backup section. To protect your password backup, select the Encrypt iPhone backup check box, and then leave it unchecked. Click the Back Now Backup button. Blackzheep/Getty Images One of the most important things you can do before the factory to rebuild the iPhone is to turn off Find My iPhone. To prevent
theft, Apple requires a separate unlock code after the phone is reset. Most people set it up when they get their phone and forget about it. When they try to reset their phone, they become locked, and there is little to can do to solve this problem. To turn off Find my iPhone, go to the settings menu. From there, tap your name and iCloud. Then tap Find my iPhone and turn it off.
oatawa/Getty Images If your phone is still running, resetting is a simple and painless process. Open the Settings menu to the general. Then select the Reset option. This opens a screen with various reset buttons. To reset to factory settings, press Delete all content and settings. If your iPhone asks for a password or An Apple ID password, enter it. Confirm that you want to delete
the device. The process may take several minutes. Preto_perola/Getty Images You have two other options to reset your phone. The first is to use iTunes, but you have to sync your device with iTunes or have had to find my iPhone at some point. This option also allows you to reset your phone if you forgot your Apple ID. Connect the iPhone to your computer with a USB cable.
Select iPhone when it appears on iTunes. You can do this from the device icon in the upper left corner. In the Summary panel, click Restore iPhone, and then click Restore again to confirm. amesy/Getty Images If you have never synced your phone to iTunes or never had Find My iPhone, you may not be able to reset your phone in the usual way. Instead, you'll need to turn off
your phone and connect it to your PC. Start iTunes. On older iPhones, hold the Home and Sleep buttons until you see a screen with iTunes and USB cable icons. If you're using the iPhone X and 8, hold the side button and don't let go when the Apple logo appears. Keep it until you see the playback mode screen. After that, iTunes should detect that you have a device in recovery
mode and a pop-up window will appear. In this pop-up menu, select Restore to reset your device to the factory. pixelfusion3d/Getty Images If your phone has been stolen or lost and you are worried about your personal information, you can still reset it in the factory. If you have enabled iCloud and Find My iPhone on your device, you can travel to the iCloud website or find my
iPhone on another device that shares the same Apple ID account. Select the device, and then click Delete. This will make factory settings on the device without the need to be nearby. PeopleImages/Getty Images When you reset your iPhone, you may want to restore your personal information. The first time you turn on your phone after resetting, it will help you set up. After
accessing the Apps &amp; Data screen, sign in to iCloud using Apple Id. Select Restore from iCloud Backup or iTunes Backup, depending on which backup you created. If you choose iTunes, you'll need to connect your phone to your pc by running iTunes. You can choose from several backups. Each of them has dates and sizes, so you know which is the most important.
Georgijevic/Getty Images When performing iPhone factory settings, it is important to choose Delete all content and settings. But options can be all you need. Reset all settings protects your data and media, but only deletes settings and Wi-Fi passwords. Reset network settings only network settings, clears the cache and removes all temporary files that your phone stores itself.
Reset the keyboard dictionary deletes personalized AutoCorrect suggestions. Reset the main screen layout to its default start menu status. Reset location and privacy resets the settings for the privacy menu and location services. shapecharge/Getty Images By ShamikaM Laptop performance may decrease over time due to software errors, unwanted applications and old files. You
can restore your laptop to factory settings with or without drives to improve performance and performance. Because operating system versions differ between laptops, check the product documentation for the exact laptop recovery procedure. Before you restore all factory settings, be sure to back up all the data elsewhere except your laptop, because playback will reformat your
hard disk by deleting all previous memory. Open the CD-ROM drive and insert the recovery disc into it. Click Start, and then select Restart. The System Restore Wizard will appear. Follow the instructions in the Recovery Wizard. Select Format partition using the NTFS file system. This will format the hard disk and erase all previous memory. Restart your laptop after recovery is
complete. Restart your computer by clicking Start and selecting Restart. When the notebook logo appears, press the appropriate function key. Depending on the model, it should be Ctrl+F11, F8, or F1. For a goal key, see product documentation. Click Restore original factory image and select OK. Follow the on-screen instructions. Restart your laptop. The laptop will be restored to
factories. At some point in the life of the device comes the time of fear of memory clean-up. This may be due to the fact that you are decoupling the company and want to make sure that it is clean from any of your personal data. Or it might just be that it became old and creaky, and it's struggling under the weight of its years – and it desperately needs a new lease of life. In such
cases, re-setting the plant is a useful option. But it's something of a nuclear option - and if you don't do it properly, you can lose all your data and, in the worst cases, break the iPhone. There is a correct and wrong way to reset your phone. Before you start, we'll show you exactly what you need to do to keep you from losing everything, including how best to back up your precious
data. Is your iPhone frozen or not responding? Follow our guide on how to reset your iPhone so you can re-create and re-operate. You should also check our troubleshooting guide because there are many steps you can take to fix iPhone problems, even if factory reset doesn't fix the problem. How to Reset iPhone Using iCloud Do You Have iPhone 12 Mini, iPhone 11 Pro, iPhone
SE SE or an even older model, such as the iPhone 4 or iPhone 5, the easiest way to reset the iPhone is to use iCloud. Step 1: Prepare your iPhone by backing up your first Apple iCloud, which is turned on by default when you sign in with your Apple ID. To decide what backups you want, go to Settings &gt; [Your name] &gt; iCloud or go to Settings &gt; iCloud in some older
versions of iOS and switch between the items you want to back up. We recommend that you choose to back up almost everything, but especially photos, mail, contacts, and notes, because factory reset will clear the lot. After switching between selections, scroll down and tap iCloud Backup, then turn on (if it's not yet) and tap Backup Up Now. Note that you'll need to be connected
to Wi-Fi and that backing up might take some time. For more detailed instructions, see our guide on how to use iCloud to back up your iPhone. You can also use your computer or laptop. Connect your iPhone to your computer via USB and click the grey Backup button now when you view the Summary tab of iTunes on a particular device. If you have a Mac that is running Catalina,
look for finder on the Devices or locations tab. Step 2: Reach the Reset menu Tap the main settings icon by viewing the Home screen, select General from the received menu, and tap the Reset button at the bottom of the page. Step 3: Reset your iPhone with the blue delete all content and settings at the top. If you don't back up as we suggested, you'll be prompted to do so. You
will then be prompted to enter your secret code. Tap the red delete iPhone pop-up option to confirm your solution. Step 4: Restore your iPhone when the reset process — a process that can take up to a few minutes — to make sure your phone is restored to its original factory settings. If this is done correctly, you will be provided with the iOS Setup Assistant again at startup. You
will have to log in and set your iPhone from scratch when it will reset. The prompts will ask if you want to recover from your iCloud account, create a completely fresh phone without any previous settings, or use iTunes and your PC to put old content back on your phone. If you are interested in what all iPhone Reset options mean, go to the last page of this article. To reset your
factory settings with iTunes, read on. How to reset iPhone using iTunes (old way) Perform factory settings on iPhone – whether it be or iPhone 11 Pro Max – easier when you use iCloud and reset directly from your device, but you can still use Apple's aging iTunes with your computer. This is useful if you have traditionally used this method and you are a long-time owner of the
iPhone. Apple has retired iTunes for MacOS, so if you using MacOS Catalina or later, syncing on Mac computers will be handled through Finder. You'll find your connected iPhone on the Devices or Locations tab. The layout is much the same as your iPhone tab in iTunes, so these instructions should work well. You can also still use iTunes on Windows computers or older Macs.
Step 1: Prepare for iPhone recovery First start iTunes as usual. If you're using a Mac, click the iTunes menu on the left side of the main toolbar, or, if you're using Windows, click the Help menu on the right. Select Check for updates from the drop-down menu, and make sure you have the latest version of iTunes. If not, download and install the latest version. If you are using a Mac
that is running Catalina, open Finder. After that, connect the iPhone to your computer via USB, and then, by viewing the Summary tab on that device, click the gray Backup button now. Also follow our guide on how to use iCloud to back up your device to Apple's remote servers. Although you don't need to back up your device, it'll save your photos, apps, contacts, settings, and
other data to automatically restore other iOS devices from a backup. If you're using an iPhone 4S or later, you'll need to turn off Find My iPhone. To do this, tap the main settings icon on the home screen, select iCloud, and then tap Find My iPhone. Then, switch the slider at the top to turn off the feature if you haven't already. Step 2: Restore the iPhone when the backup is
complete by viewing the Summary tab of the device, click the gray button restore the iPhone. In the pop-up window you received, click the Restore button to confirm your solution, and if prompted, click I accept to accept the software license agreement and start downloading the required iOS software file before you can restore it. Step 3: Make sure your phone has been restored
when the recovery process is complete — the process can take up to a few minutes – to make sure your phone is restored to its original factory settings. If this is done correctly, you will be provided with the iOS Setup Assistant again at startup, from which you can restore your phone from a backup or continue the process as if you're resetting it. It's like it just came to the assembly
line again. Andrew Martonik/ Digital Trends What do all those different reset options mean? When you reset your iPhone, iOS provides many different options and it may be confusing to decide which ones to choose from. You will normally want to make the above factory settings, but explains what other options do to choose the best recovery for your needs. Note: If you sell your
phone or switch to it to someone else, the only one who safely deletes everything and takes your phone to its original state is Delete all content and settings. Genevieve Poblano/Digital Trends Reset All Settings If you choose this option, you will not lose all your data, but you will lose settings and Wi-Fi passwords. Manual settings will disappear, of course, but you'll still have
photos, apps, and other content. Delete all content and settings This is an option we described at the beginning of this post that deletes everything from your device. Your settings, pictures, apps, and other data will disappear unless you back up the content. Reset network settings Sometimes you just need to update your network settings to set up a better connection. This option
resets network settings, clears the cache, and deletes all temporary files that you store on your device. This is great for those who experience problems with different Wi-Fi connections. Reset keyboard dictionary Sometimes AutoCorrect can do more harm than good. If you think your iPhone always offers spelling mistakes and misspellings based on previous messages, you can
always reset your keyboard dictionary. Reset the main screen layout Although most people like to set their smartphone's home screen with their favorite apps, sometimes it's nice to change things a little. If you ever want to return to the original home screen layout that's provided with your phone, you can choose this reset option. Reset location and privacy Sometimes when you
start tapping in settings, you can mess it up. If you want to return to your phone's original privacy and location settings, this is a reset. All other information will remain intact. Recommendations for editorial recommendations
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