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African sun goddess names

Nana Buluku ( Nana, Nan Nan, Nana Baruku, Na Na Baraclou, Boucalou ) As Nana Buluku, she is the primitive creator goddess of Benin's Fon Nation (Dahomey). As Nana Buruku, she is the first grandmother to all deities and the first human woman in the Yorubas religion. Grandma had cosmic twins Mawu and Lisa. Mawu and Lisa
became a cosmic egg and a cosmic seed that easting the egg. This egg was formed from the center of ashe in the world of Ikode Orun. This egg hatched the Great Irunmole. Nana Baruku is olodumare's uterus, Mawu's cosmic egg and Lisa Olodmare's seed. Once they are mobilized, they are the creation of all that is, was and always will
be. When a orisha named Obatala formed the first human head on earth, olodumare came down from the great Adobe of the spiritual world and breathed life into it. Through the mysteries of Olodmare's breathing, Nana Baruku first stepped forward and lived inside a clay figure, becoming the first living soul. Thus, Nana Baruku was both a
great divine, firstly ancestors, great-grandmother of deities, but also an ancient grandmother and the ancestor of mankind. In human form, Nana Buruku was known as Ayizan. Ayizan, (Nanan) is pictured as an ancient black grandmother, her face covered with palm heaps in honor of the palm trees she used to create shelter in the ground.
In his arms, Ayizan carries a woven basket containing shell, roots and herbs. Ayizan was the first human herbalist, sacred to him is a mandrake root that resembles the human form and is a symbol of his human husband, Osanyin. With extensive herbal knowledge, he caught the attention of Orisha Osanyin, who took shape and became
known as Loco. In life, Ayizan lived in a swamp swamp, he was a powerful ancestor unparalleled because of his herbs and knowledge of root magic. Sacred to him is the quicksand that surrounded his home and protected him from wildlife. African gods and goddesses Most African cultures, if not all, believe in the Supreme Creator in one
form or another.  God behind the gods, the Supreme God who created everything.  The Creator is thought to have once lived on Earth, but left it in his kingdom in the sky because of human transgression.  Since he was no longer in direct contact with the people, the Smaller Gods were created directly from His power to do certain works
assigned to them.  These smaller gods are gods of Earth, rains, water, winds, fire, etc.  Deities are able to answer people's prayers by using their own power and can pray for man with the Creator himself.  Although he is usually referred to the Supreme Creator, etc., it is beyond sex because it is both male and female.  It has no form and
is thought of in an abstract way.  No, it's. no human being, regardless of their status.  The breath of its divine being is all-animated and unasswered. It is known as Mulungu (East Africa), Leza (Central Africa), Nyambe (West Tropics), Nyame (Ghana), Molder, The God of Destiny, one who exists by himself, a God of pity and comfort, an
inexplicable, ancient of days, the one who bends even kings, one you meet everywhere, etc. Among many tribes, it took four days to create the earth.  The fifth day was reserved for the worship of Orisha Nla (Chief of Deities), who actually created the land with the guidance and help of the Supreme Creator.  Orisha Nla was also tasked
with creating bodies from clay.  When this was finished, the Supreme Creator secretly placed the spark of life within forms.  These newly created people were then placed on earth in life. Gods and Goddesses Adroa Other names: God in heaven, God on earth, God God, River God. Hotel Area: Zairen and Ugandan Lugbara. He is
described as tall and white with only half his body visible. Rules over: Social order, law, death. Akuji location: Turkana, Kenya. Rules over: Prediction. Start Other names: Ale, Ane. Hotel Area: Nigerian Ibo. A very popular goddess and mother of Earth. She's the Goddess and queen of the dead. Rules: Community laws, morality, oaths,
harvest. Anayaroli Location: Temne. Description: River demon. Rules over: Prosperity. Asa Other names: Father God, strong Lord. Hotel Area: Kenyan Akamba. Rules over: Grace, help, coping with the impossible. Asase Other names: Yaa, Aberewa, Efua, Old Woman Earth. Location: West African Ashanti. Description: Goddess creation
of people and recipient in their death. Rules: Cultivation, harvesting. Behanz Location: West Africa. Description: Fish God. Cagn location: South Central Africa among bushmans. Description: God God. Rules over: Witchness and metamorphosis. Chiuta Other names: Mulengi, Mwenco, Wamtatakuya Tumbuka. Description: God God, Rain
God.  You're self-made and know-it-all. Rules over: Rain, aid, plant growth, food. Chuku Other names: Chineke. Hotel Area: Eastern Nigerian Ibo. Description: The first great reason, God, Father Ale, goddess of earth.  The offerings and sacrifices were made on his behalf in the ly leaves. Rules over: Help, for Goodness's time. Danh's
location: Dahomey. Description: Snake God.  You can see the rainbow snake in his mouth. Rules over: Totality, unity. En-Kai Other names: Asparagi, Emayian. Location: Masai. Description: Sky God.  Grass is used in rituals for him. Rules over: Rain, vegetation, blessings. Fa location: Dahomey. Rules over: Fate. Famia's location:
Guinea. Rules over: Protection, health, fertility. Gauna Other names: Gawa, Gawama. Among the Bushmen. Description: Leads the powerful dead. Rules over: Disorders, harassment, death. Ge Location: Dahomey. Description: Moon God. Gu Location: West African fon. Rules over: War, seconds. Guruh's location: Gambia. Description:
Evil God.  Meteors are his mark. Rules over: Power and death to enemies. Heitsi-Eibib location:. Description: Wizard God. Rules over: Shape-shifter, magic. Imana Other names: Hategekimana, Hashakimana, Habyarimana, Ndagijimana, Bigirimana, Almighty God. Location: Banyarwands. Rules over: Power, for goodness time, children,
planning. Big Other names: First Obasi, Obasi Nsi, Ibibio, Ekoi. Location: West Africa. Description: Turtle peeled goddess. Rules over: Earth fertility. Other names: Jok Odudu, Alur. Location: Uganda and Zaire. Description: Black goats had to be sacrificed to him when rain was needed. Rules over: Rain. Juok Other names: Shilluk,
Supreme God. Location: White Nile. Description: Created by all men on the ground. Kaka-Guia Other names: Nyami. Location: Volta areas. He brought souls to the Supreme God. Katonda Other names: Lissoddene, Kagingo, Ssewannaku, Lugaba, Ssebintu, Nnyiniggulu, Namuginga, Ssewaunaku, Gguluddene, Namugereka. Location:
East African Ganda. Description: God God. Rules over: Help, judgment, help when probabilities are against you, spirit control, prediction, oracle. Kwoth location: Nuer of South Sudan. Description: Great Spirit God. Rules over: Nature, help, compassion, judgment. Leza location: Dahomey. Description: Chameleon God/dess. Rules over:
Protection, prediction. Mbaba Mwana Waresa Location: Natalin Zulu. Description: Goddess of what she controls. Rules: Rainbows, rain, crops, cultivation, beer. Mawu location: Dahomey. Description: Highest Goddess, all.  West African Benin's fon worships Mawu as the goddess of the moon and as a creatrix of everything. Mukuru
Location: Macouas Zambesi, Banayis. Description: Supreme God, God everything. Rules: Agriculture, architecture, harvest. Mungo location: Giryama, Kenya. Description: Rain God. Rules over: Rain. Nenaunir Other names: Rainbow Snake. Location: Kenyan Masai. Description: Evil Storm God, which was a linked rainbow.  He lived in
the clouds and was a feared spirit. Rules over: Storms. Ngai Location: Masai. Description: God God. Rules over: Life and death. Ngami Description: Goddess of the Moon. Njambi Location: Lele. Description: God God. Rules: Protection, justice, aid, forests, fertility. Nyambe Location: All over Nigeria. Description: God. Rules over:
Restoring life. Nyambi Other names: Nyambe. Location: Upper Zamben barotse. Description: Gread God.  Everything. Nyame location: West African Twi. Description: A great God who prepared the soul to be reborn on a physical level and gave his destiny. Rules over: Fate. Nyamia Ama Location: Senegal. Description: God storms, rain
and lightning.  The god of heaven. Rules over: Storms, rains, lightning. Nambi location: Congo Bankongo. Description: The great goddess who created everything.  He played the role of justice and was rewarded and punished according to man's actions. Oba Description: Santeria River Goddess. Okkumare location: Yoruba. Description:
Santeria Goddess Rainbow. Oddudua Location: Yoruba. Description: Primary mother goddess. Ogun Other names: Ogoun. Location: Nago and Yoruba in West Africa. Description: God iron and warfare. Rules over: Iron, warfare, removing difficulties, paving the path to the desired outcome, Justice, Smiths, Hunters, Barbers, Goldsmiths,
Steel. Olorun Other names: Olofin-Orun, Olodumare. Hotel Area: Yoruba. Description: Sky God. Rules Over: Truth, Element Control, Anticipation, Victory when odds are against you, Destiny. Pan location: Agni. Description: Son of the Earth. Rules: Cultivation. Rock-Sens location: Gambian Seerer. Description: Heaven God, ruled the
weather. Rules over: Rain, Thunder, Lightning. Rugaba Other names: Ruhanga, Kazooba, Mukameiguru. Location: Ankore from Uganda. Description: God God, God of the Sun, God of Heaven. Rules over: Life, healing, death, illness, judgment. Ruhanga location: Banyoro. Description: Great God. Rules Above: Fertility, Abundance,
Children, Animals, Harvest, Health, Disease, Death, Judgment, Rebirth. Sakarabru Location: Guinean Agni. Description: God, who is strongest in the main stages of the Moon.  Quick to punish wrong deeds. Rules over: Medicine, justice, revenge. Shango Other names: Schango. Hotel Area: Yoruba in Nigeria. Description: Carry a two-
headed axe much like the Nordic Thorr. Rules over: Thunder, storm, war, magic. Soko Location: Nupe in northern Nigeria. Description: God God. Rules: Element management, witchness, communication with the deceased. Tilon location: Mozambique. Description: Sky God. Rules over: Sky, thunder, rain. Unkulunkulu Other names:
Nkulnkulu. Location: Zimbabwe's Amazulu and Ndebele. Description: Great God, God of earth. Rules over: Fertility, organization, order. Utixo Location:. Description: Heaven God who speaks with a voice of thunder. Rules: Rain, Storms, Thunder, Harvest, Rebirth. Wele Other names: Khakaba, Isaywa. Location: Abaluyia, Bantu.
Description: High.  Heaven God, God God. Rules over: Rain, storms, lightning, creation, wealth, harvesting, celestial phenomena. Were the location: Kenyan Luo. Great God, Father God, God God. Rules: Birth, death, nature, judgment. White woman's location: Saharan Tassali. Description: Agriculture Goddess. Rules over: Agriculture,
fertility. Xevioso Location: West Africa. He used a thunder scar. Rules over: Thunder, rain, fertility. Ymoja Location: Yoruba. Description: River Goddess. Rules over: Women, children. Children.
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